
AGENDA ITEM: 2-B 

Design Review Subcommittee (DRSC)
Meeting Date:  July 29, 2024 

PLANNER: 

SUBJECT: 

Jonathan Lightfoot, City Planner 

Public Hearing Project (PHP) 24-246, Rasta Taco Mixed-Use, 
424 N El Camino Real, a request to develop a new mixed-use 
building with two ground floor commercial spaces, including a 
restaurant with beer, wine, and alcohol sales for indoor 
and outdoor consumption, and a residential unit and an ADU 
on the second floor above. The project includes a Development 
Permit (DP 24-247) and a Conditional Use Permit (CUP 22-246).

BACKGROUND: 

The property at 424 N. El Camino Real is within the Mixed Use 3.0 zoning district and the 
Architectural and Pedestrian/ Central Business overlay zoning districts (MU3.0-CB-A). The 
property was developed with a 390 square foot building on a 6065 square foot property, 
most recently utilized by a salon business. The property currently provides vehicular access 
both from El Camino Real and from the rear alley. The site is adjacent to a property on the 
City’s local register of historic resources located at 420 N. El Camino Real. The applicant 
proposes to demolish the existing salon building and replace it with a mixed-use building, 
consisting of two ground floor commercial suites (702 sf) with adjacent patio (584 sf) and a 
second story residence (986 sf) with an accessory dwelling unit (779 sf). Each unit would 
have an attached deck, and the primary unit would have a 351 sf roof deck. This permit was 
originally submitted as a Site Plan Permit and a Cultural Heritage Permit. After adoption of 
the 2023 Streamlining Ordinance, the appropriate permit type is now a Development Permit. 

ANALYSIS: 

Site Plan 

The applicant proposes to close the El Camino Real frontage to vehicular access, which 
improves the pedestrian orientation of the street scene. Similarly, the project locates the 
building close to the primary street while tucking parking behind with access from the alley, 
which is consistent with site layout standards of the City’s Design Guidelines. Pedestrian 
access is maintained along the side property lines. This pedestrian access also serves to 
provide a 5-foot buffer, where no setback is required. This setback provides spacing from 
the historic property to the south, “a one-story commercial building with a rectangular plan 
and wood-frame construction” (refer to DPR Form, Attachment 3).  

At the front of the property, the applicant proposes a covered patio up to the property line. 
This is consistent with the pattern of development along the street. These properties appear 
to have a front setback of about 7-feet because the back of sidewalk does not extend the 
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full width of the right of way. Within this additional 7 feet of public property, other properties 
have installed landscaping, or extended paving or ramps into the business entrance. The 
subject development proposes to infill this space with decomposed granite (DG) material, 
and requests to use this space for additional outdoor dining, which can be permitted 
pursuant to SCMC 17.28.2050F

1. Because of the minimal landscaping proposed on site, 
particularly at the front of the development, staff recommends that a portion of this 
encroachment area be dedicated to landscaping. Finally, 36 seats are shown for shared use 
of the two food and beverage tenants. Based on the provided parking, a maximum of 33 
seats are permitted as there are 5 parking stalls dedicated to the commercial uses (25 seats 
parked + 8 “free” outdoor seats, per SCMC 17.28.205). 

At the rear, there is one-way vehicular access from the alley. The design is driven in part by 
an existing-to-remain SDGE power pole. The area around the pole serves as the turning 
radius and the primary landscape bed. Currently, deer grass is the only proposed plant 
material for the property. There are seven parking stalls, three of which are covered, to 
support the commercial and residential uses, and additional on-street space will be created 
through the removal of the existing driveway on El Camino Real. The applicant is looking for 
an exception to a couple of non-codified standards due to the site constraints and limited 
parking: use of an interior trapzilla grease interceptor instead of an underground grease 
interceptor and use of trash carts in a narrow enclosure (5’ by 18’) instead of three-yard bins 
(which would require a minimum 9’ by 13’). From the rear, there is an ADA accessible path 
to the commercial spaces fronting on El Camino Real, and there is a stairwell providing 
access to the residential units. 

Architecture 

The project’s location within the Architectural Overlay requires a Spanish Colonial Revival 
(SCR) architectural design. The project does provide SCR elements, including stucco siding, 
tile roofing at a 3:12 pitch, fenestration with divided lites, and an asymmetrical elevation that 

1 SCMC 17.28.205 

https://library.municode.com/ca/san_clemente/codes/code_of_ordinances?nodeId=TIT17ZO_CH17.28SPUS_17.28.205OUDIAR
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clearly identifies the primary entry through a pronounced wall plane. The project also 
provides transitional outdoor space by bringing entry through a semi enclosed, roofed patio 
area. The primary area of concern on the front elevation is the width of the columns around 
the arched elements. Similarly, the patio area has open access on the side elevations that 
create the same visual issue of showing full massing above narrow supporting structures. 
This is a result of squeezing stairs and an ADA lift on the southern side elevation; the lift 
provides a required connection to the ADA path to the parking lot and trash enclosure. 
However, the stairs could be removed in favor of providing standard pedestrian access via 
the sidewalk in front of the property. The west elevation could utilize a door instead of a 
building opening to accomplish access to the non-ADA pathway on that side of the building. 
The window of the coffee shop also appears to be partially blocked by the location of the lift. 
The plan sets have been annotated to identify the location of potential areas of improvement 
or where clarifying information is needed.  

At the rear, site constraints have led to a lower quality SCR representation. Typically, 
residential parking is required to be covered. This is not an explicit code requirement when 
residences are a component of Mixed-Use development. However, the owner has tried to 
incorporate covered spaces as a portion of the off-street parking for the project. The resulting 
elevation includes arched openings on the lower level. This again results in the undesirable 
effect of narrow columns supporting heavy massing above. The worst element is the far left 
portion of the elevation with the narrow rectangular opening. Again, a door could be 
incorporated to give the appearance of more solid massing. Another option could be to pull 
back the roof line above the second level deck space. Reducing the “weight” of full roofing 
over the deck(s) could also help to bring better balance to the rear elevation.  

Finally, the project is adjacent to a historic resource and must be compatible with that 
existing building. The applicant provided an elevation that incorporates the proposed project 
alongside the historic building. While the proposed structure is larger, it matches the front 
setback and complies with the height of the zone while also providing a side setback that 
allows for separation from the historic building. It incorporates a first floor eyebrow roof 
element that helps to break up the massing on the side of the development closest to the 
historic building. The building materials and details are compatible.  

RECOMMENDATIONS: 

Staff recognizes that creativity is required when working on Mixed-Use projects with site 
constraints. The project has good potential, and staff seeks recommendations from the 
DRSC, related to design and architecture, to further improve the project before it advances 
to the Planning Commission. 

Attachments: 

1. Annotated Plans
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