Agenda ltem TA
Approvals:

AGENDA REPORT City Manager é 44&

Dept. Head = '
SAN CLEMENTE CITY COUNCIL MEETING Attorney. 1

¥ -
Meeting Date: November 5, 2013 Ei
nance EaEE

Department.  Community Development / Building Division
Prepared By: Mike Jorgensen, Building Official W .

Subject: FIRST READING - ORDINANCE TO ADOPT VARIOUS BUILDING CODE REGULATIONS AND
LocAL AMENDMENTS

Fiscal Impact: None.

Summary: Staff recommends that the Council introduce for first reading an Ordinance
amending Chapters 15.08, 15.12, 15.16, 15.20, 15.21, and 15.22 of the San
Clemente Municipal Code adopting various building regulations and amendments
and adopt a Resolution setting forth findings for amendments reasonably necessary
due to local conditions.

Background: January 1, 2014 is the statewide effective date established by the California Building
Standards Commission for the new 2013 California Building Standards Code.

Every three years the State of California Building Standards Commission (BSC)
reviews the newest model codes published by various independent code-developing
bodies. These model codes are sent to the BSC and the other state agencies that
propose or adopt building standards. These model codes with state amendments
from the various state agencies become the California Building Standards Code.

The California Building Standards Code, Title 24, are the established minimum
regulations for the design and construction of buildings and structures in California.
State law mandates that local government enforce these regulations.

Local ordinances amending building standards approved/adopted by the
Commission are subject to requirements of California law. Local ordinances
generally must be more restrictive than the minimum building standards
approved/adopted by the Commission. These local amendments must be filed, as
appropriate, with either the Building Standards Commission or the Department of
Housing and Community Development.

In order for these building regulations to be adopted and local amendments effective
on January 1, 2014 it is necessary to introduce the attached building codes
ordinance for first reading at the November 5, 2013 City Council Meeting.

Building Agenda Report 4'4/



Agenda Report

Discussion:

Page 2

California Code of Regulations, Title 24 — the 2013 California Building Standards
Code, incorporates the family of codes listed below and becomes effective statewid”
on January 1, 2014.

Part 1 of Title 24
2013 California Administrative Code

Part 2 of Title 24
2013 California Building Code (Volumes 1 & 2)
[Based on the 2012 International Building Code (IBC) as amended by the State]

Part 2.5 of Title 24
2013 California Residential Code
[Based on the 2012 International Residential Code (IRC) as amended by the State]

Part 3 of Title 24
2013 California Electrical Code
[Based on the 2011 National Electrical Code (NEC) as amended by the State]

Part 4 of Title 24
2013 California Mechanical Code
[Based on the 2012 Uniform Mechanical Code (UMC) as amended by the State]

Part 5 of Title 24
2013 California Plumbing Code
[Based on the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code (UPC) as amended by the State]

Part 6 of Title 24
2013 California Energy Code

Part 8 of Title 24
2013 California Historical Building Code

Part 9 of Title 24
2013 California Fire Code
[Based on the 2012 International Fire Code (IFC) as amended by the State]

Part 10 of Title 24
2013 California Existing Building Code
[Based on the 2012 International Existing Building Code (IEBC) as amended by the

State]

Part 11 of Title 24
2013 California Green Building Standards Code (CALGreen Code)

Part 12 of Title 24
2013 California Referenced Standards Code

s



Agenda Report

Page 3

Code Amendments & Uniformity

Any city, county, or fire protection district may establish more restrictive
amendments to the building standards than those contained in the California
Building Standards Code (California Code of Regulations, Title 24), if the
amendment is reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological, or
topographical conditions. Most cities including San Clemente adopt these State
Codes with local amendments in order to address special conditions that exist in the
jurisdiction.

The proposed ordinance adopts the building regulations prescribed by state law,
adopts local amendments to those codes based on special local conditions and
adopts administrative provisions for the enforcement of these Codes.

As done with previous code adoptions, the San Clemente Building Division strived to
minimize code amendments except where administrative in nature or to where
needed to address special construction and fire issues unique to San Clemente
related to unstable geotechnical, expansive and corrosive soils conditions,
topography and our proximity to natural canyons and grassy areas. In an effort to
reduce regulations a number of previous local amendments have been eliminated or
simplified based on council direction at the October 1, 2013 council meeting.

Many of our local amendments are related to coordination of OCFA requirements
between the Fire Code and the Building Code. A summary of local amendments
proposed by the City and/or OCFA is included in Attachment #1.

The related resolution provides findings that local conditions make the changes to
the California Building, Electrical, Mechanical and Plumbing Codes reasonably
necessary for building occupancies in the City. The proposed ordinance and
resolution of findings for local amendments comply with State law for adoption of
codes and local amendments.

Training & Public Notification
In-house staff training is currently underway to begin familiarization with new and

revised code provisions.

It is important for design and construction professionals to begin familiarizing
themselves with the upcoming changes. A number of good publications are
available from the International Code Council (ICC) that cover the code changes in
great detail. Training on the new codes is currently available through a number of
professional associations including the International Code Council (ICC), and the
California Building Officials (CALBO).

Additionally, as the City has done in the past, the Building Division is working on
development of a series of code update training sessions for the design and
construction community. This free training is anticipated to be offered this coming
winter or spring.

Public information is currently available on the City website that provides important
information regarding this upcoming change to construction codes used in the State

75



Agenda Report

Recommended

Action:

Page 4

of California. Visitors to the Building Division are also receiving notification handouts
regarding the new codes and their effective date.

Conclusion

The proposed ordinance and resolution will amend Chapter 15 of the San Clemente
Municipal Code and adopt the most current mandatory State regulations while
allowing the City to address special local conditions.

STAFF RECOMMENDS THAT the City Council

1.

Introduce for first reading Ordinance No. entitled, AN ORDINANCE OF
THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN CLEMENTE, CALIFORNIA,
AMENDING CHAPTERS 15.08, 15.12, 15.16, 15.20, 15.21, AND 15.22 OF
TITLE 15 OF THE SAN CLEMENTE MUNICIPAL CODE ADOPTING BUILDING
REGULATIONS.

Adopt Resolution No. entitled, A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL
OF THE CITY OF SAN CLEMENTE, CALIFORNIA, SETTING FORTH FINDINGS WITH
RESPECT TO LOCAL CONDITIONS WITHIN THE CITY OF SAN CLEMENTE WHICH
MAKE CERTAIN MODIFICATIONS AND CHANGES TO THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING
CODE, THE CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE, THE CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL
CODE, THE CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE, THE CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL
CODE, AND THE CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE
REASONABLY NECESSARY FOR VARIOUS OCCUPANCIES

Attachments: #1—Summary of Amendments Matrix — 2013 California Building, Electrical,

Notification:

Mechanical, Plumbing, CALGreen, and Residential Codes

#2 — Ordinance No.
#3 — Resolution No.

None

i:\building\2013 code adoption - final versions\agenda report - bldg code adoption 1st reading - 1 1-5-13.docx

74+



Attachment — 1

Attachment “1”
a9-5



1 ¢ 10)dey) WOy Pajeoo[y uonuya( SunsIxy | 3unsixg 20T dc
t 191dey)) wWoIy payeoo[ny uonIuga( Sunsixy (VAD0) | Sunsixg 202 V¢
S99, UoNo3dsuIdy — SANRNSTUIWPY unsixyg L0011 SI
sys0do(] — SATRISIUIIPY | BUNSIXY L'601 Al
SpUNJoY 99, — FATRISTUIUIPY |  BUnSIXy 9601 Ol
UL ORI SHOM 10§ 39,] UONESNISOAU] — SANRNSTUIWDY | BUBSIXY ¥'601 d1
uoneneA 19901 JO UOTIRUTULINS( — SANRISTUTWPY Sunsixyg €601 01
(uonnjosay 994 Sunsixy 12d) $99,] JIULISJ — FATRNSIUTWPY |  SUNSIXY 601 NI
99, SurSew] JUSWNOO(] JO JUSWARJ — SATRISTUTWPY |  SunsIXyg S LOT W1
30, 93y Ue[d JO JuewAed ~ SATIBISIIIWPY |  SUnSIXY €101 1
spoday s[10§ soXmbay - eAneNSIIWPY | unsIXy 9'T'L01 M1
uononsuo)) Suunp A110do1 JO SOUBUIUIRIA - SATBNSUIUPY | unsixyg 6'S01 (1
UOTIONINSUOY) I0] SSUIRIIWIL], UOTO[AIIO)) - SANRISIUTWIPY gunstxyg 601 11
uoneidx{ JIULS] - SATRNSIUTWPY | SUnSIXy $'501 HI
SYOOY) el 10§ SUONEIIMIT QWL - SATEISIUIPY wﬂﬂ% TES0T )
sunsixg ]
SHULIO WOl 1dwoXy Y10 - SANRISUNIDY I TS0t a1
9poy) spIepuelS wnﬁvmﬁmm U331L) 0] IUIY — QATIBI)STUTWIPY wﬁﬁmwxm 8V 101 Al
QPO TeI1II[H O} AOURIJIY — SATIRISTUIIUPY wﬂﬁwﬂxm LV 101 dal
S3PO)) I 0} AURINJSY — SANRNSIUTWIPY Sunstxyg 7’101 I
odoog - oATENSIUTWIPY | BUnSIXY 101 d1
suone[n3oy uIp[ing Jo oNIL], — SANRNSIUIUPY |  SupsIxy 1'101 V1
SJUAWPUSWY IPO)) surpping
Aremung unwﬂﬁ”ﬁﬁw uonods ..Q—HMMW_U
9Jo 1 a3eq
€10T °S 1oqUIAON
199US Areurumng

SIUSWIPUSUIY |20 9JUSWA[)) UeS
S3POD) TeNUSPISY / UISID) / FUIqUINJ / [BOTUEYOSJA / [EOLIIOSE / SUIP[IN BILIOFIED £10T

gA-




(uoyeoyLIE[0) — [00J 2JBAL JO UONIUYS( |  SUnSIXg I'V¥601¢ J1¢
syuswaambaz A110)/01e1g Sumstxy 1od 199] ¢ 01 199] § woi S0y Surous,] Ioteg [00d AJIPOJN | Sunsixyg I'v'601€ qi1¢
sjuouraambar A1) /0181 Bunstxy 1od 199] ¢ 03 199]  wox IO Surous,] Io1req [00d AJIPON | Sunsixy €601¢ VIE

A pue g ‘q se1108918) uB1s9(] OTWISIAS UI SUFISI(J [[BA\ UOTIBPUNO,] 9ATIdLIOSAI SHQIYOIJ MAN 91,081 V81
JuoaImbay SuLLA0)) JOOY . V,, SSBID Soyadg | Junsixyg 1'1°S0ST DS1
JuswRImbay] SuleA0) JOOy .V, SSB) soljoads | Sunsixy 1°SOST 9[qeLl. qs1
Urel(] WI0}S JO/PUR 1991)S 0] PAKIAU0)) A[PATINJH 2q 0} adeutei(] Jooy IoJ juowarmbay |  Bunsixyg $°€0S1 VSI
sauTepINg V00 1od SWISAS uLey 211] SULONUON (VAD0) MON $'9'L06 6
$301A9(T SunenIU] ULy osTY-YSIH (VID0) | Bunsixy TE9L06 16
Wa)SAG UOIEOUNUITIOY) WLIETY 20T0A AoudSiowry (VID0) | Sunsxyg TTSLO6 H6
$1030213(J 20§ Jon(] Jo uonedgLEe[) (VID0) |  Sunsixyg 1°¢°L06 D6
SWSAS ULIR[Y/ /3010 A —329J §G 01 199f ¢/ W0y JYSIoY Surp[ing osu-y3ry AJipoN (V.ID0) | Sunsixg €1°TLO6 d6
suondauuo)) asof adidpue)g jo uoneoo ] (V.ID0) | Sunsixy ¥'506 g6
Swrely pue uoisiatedng weisAg ropuudg (VAD0) | Sunsixg ' €06 de
swosAg JopuLdg 211 pejeofe) AeornerpA 10§ suoisiroid (VA00) MON £6°€€06 06
sorouednoo() TenuUapISay — SJUSWLIMbaY WSAS IopuLidg a11,] onewony | Sunsixy 8°7°€06 g6
syuswarmbayy woysAg 1opundg a1r,] onewoy | Sunsmxyg €06 V6
ZSHAHA Ul samjonng £1085300y apnjouy 0} 38uwey) (V.100) MIN y'VOIL gL
ZSHAHA Ul samjonng £108s900y apnjou] 03 a3uey) (VI00) MIN CEVOIL VL
suoisiaoxd Arroe Surpue] 131doorol] Aouedrowy seuyge( (VID0) | Sunsixy 9L Ty qAp
90149(7 dei], 10 101eIRdag 110 posoiddy we 01 UTRI(] 0} SIOO[ d3erer) 10] Juowarmbay |  Sunsixg Sv90p ay
spodre)) pue saferer) Ul sooe}ING I00[] S[qUISNQUIO)-UON] JO Juswarmbay | Sumsixg € €90p I
sunsixyg i
193] 66 01399 51, WO JYBIOH SUIPIINg OSH-YSHH AIPON (VAIO) | pyrmory I°€0¥ dy
qummumm
109J §€ 03399] G/, WO JYSISH SuIp[ing SSH-Y3IH AJPON (VID0) I €op v
¥ 191dey) wog pajeootey suonmuya( Sunsixy (VAD0) | Sunsixy 20T 0T

9 Jo 7 98eg
€10T °S IquIdAoN
199US Arewruuns
SIUSWIPUIWY [B207] QJUIUII])) URG

S3p0D) [eNULPISIY / Us0LD) / BulquIN|q / [EON™ 7SN / [BOLIOSIT / SuIp[Ing BIUIOFED €107

77



juowaImbay spo) Sulqumd yum s[eLjely Sutdid sep JO UOPeUIpIoo) | BunsIXy $'80€1 0]
sdo ] -}00)) o1sowIo(] J0J WAISAS ISneyxy 10J JuawaImbay Sunsixyg 10S q
$9p0)) 19710 YIIM UONEUIPIOO]) - SANRNSTUIDY |  BUNSIXF 011 \4

SJUSWPUIUWY IPO)) [EITUBYIIA]

SuLIIA WNUTUM]Y JO 95() 9 U0 SUOROmsey | Sumsixg QMMMW ‘1 a

UL\ WINUIEM]Y JO 9S[) A7) UO SUONOLYSYY |  SunsiXyg (@)901°01¢€ 0
sunsixyg .

sSurp[ing MoN] 10] [eo1n09[d punoidiopu() sarmboy &wvmz (7 s°00¢€ q

SSp0)) I9YJ0 1M UOJBUIPIOOT) - SANJRISTUTUIDY Sumsixyg 0°06 \4

SHUAUPUIWY IPO)) [BILIIIIY

sumsixyg

seoueudpnddy JISY ] PUE SUTEIA SOIAISS OIL] SJBALL] JO UOLR[[BISU] — $T VdIN (VAD0) @ow%.oz ¥¢ VdAN qs¢
sw)sAg 9soy odidpuelg Jo uoneeIsUf — ( ) wﬁwmﬂxm

1SAS 9SO odIdpue)§ JO UOUE[[BISU] — ¥T VdAN (VAOO0 POLTPOIN 1 VAAN ass

sowoy | Bunsxy

paImjorynElN pue SBUIAM( Afrure] ¢ pue | U1 SwaysAs Jopunds Jo vonelmsu] - 4] VAIN (VaD0) | poyrpopy | IEF VAN | OsE

SOLIO)G INO | SUNSIXY

Surpnjou] pue 0} dn sarourdnoo() eRUAPISTY UI SWAYSAS Jop[uLidg Jo none[RIsul — Y€1 VAAN (VAD0) |  PIYIPON del VdiIN ase

swiasAg JopyuLds Jo uoneyreisul — €1 VAN (VID0) SuSIXe €1 VdiIN A4
. . PIUIPOA
sSuIp[ing poyedo[ay 0} paje[al sjuowalmbay] | Sunsixyg Mmﬂwm \4%3
juowdmby edg 1004 10] UOTIENUSYY PUNOS 9PIAOCIJ O} JUSWRIMbay |  Junsixyg L'601€ q1€

sjuowaImbay amsopug Puregedg jood | Bumsxg | ¢yveole | dlI€

930 ¢ 98ed
€10T S IqUISAON
1o9yS Arewuung
STUSTIPUSUTY [B207] JUSW[)) URS
S3POD) [eRUSPISSY / USAID) / SUIqUIN|J / [ESTIRYOSJA / [edLI0S[H / SuIp[ing eruIoyife) 107

947-£




uoponnsuo)) Surmp A10do1J JO 90UBUUIRIA - SANBISIUTWIPY 3unsixyg 11°s01d DI
TONONNSUO)) JOJ SOWRIJoUHL [, UOTIQ[dUIO)) - SATIRISTUIWIPY sunsixyg 01°S0Td Al
uonendxy JULSJ - SANRNSIUNIPY 3unsixg S§'s0Td q1
SYoeU) Ue|J 10] SUOTEIMIT SUIL] - SANENSTUTPY MWM TESOTd ar
SjruLIo J wol] 1dwoxy JIOA - QATIRISTUTWPY mqwmim ra S IR 1
HULIS J WOy d JHOM I uwp AFIPOIN
2doog - eATIENSTUTIIPY Sunsixyg C10Td =41
suorjen3oy [RIUSPISSY JO SNL], AJLIR[D — SANRHSIUTWPY Sunsxg T'T10TY V1

SHIAWPUIWY IPO)) [CIIUIPISIY

Juawdo[aAa( MON UT PI[[BISU] 2q 0} SIS[[O1U0)) uoneSILy

Sunsixyg

['¥0EP

q

Anqeurelsng — pappy uonmuyga(g

sunsixyq

(4114

v

SJUAWPUINY IPO)) SPIEPUEL)S FUIP[INg UL

S[I0G SAISOLIO)) Ul pas() Udaym Furdid Sep [eIOJA SNOLIS,] JO 3S[) S} UO SUOHOLISIY

sunstxg $'802C1 D

S[IOS SAISOLIO)) UI P3S[) USYM UOI] ISB)) JO 9S() oY) U0 suonomsay |  Sumsixg (D1 10L qd

sjuswaImbay 1opfuLdg 03 an(g sur Ajddng 19184\ I0JOUIRI(] WNWIUIA YOUT-SU() 10 Juswaimbay | Sunsxyg 8019 q
S[I0S 9AISO1I0)) UI pas) Uaym Sutdig 1o1ep\ 1oddo) Surspy 1o juswannbai jeroadg | Sunsixg (D€609 a

S[I0S SAISOLIO)) UI pas() uaym Sutdi] 1A Ioddo) Sursp) 1oy juowennbar [eoadg | Sumsxyg 7109 9

S[10S SAISOLIO)) UL pas() uaym Jurdid I9)eA\ [RISJA] SNOLIS,] JO 9S[) O} UO SUONOINSYY | Sunsixy 1'%09 q

$9p0D) 19Y}0 IM UOHBUIPIOO]) - SANRNSTUIWPY |  ZUnSIXY £'e0l v

SHUWPUIUY IPO)) SUIquInyJ

930  38ed
€10T °S I9quaA0N
199§ Areurmng

SIUSWIPUSUTY [BO07] QJUSWA[)) UBS

S9pOD) [ENUSPISAY / URLD) / SuIqUIN{ / [eOT0™ O / [ROI0S[H / BUIP[INg IWIOfe) €107



JuawaImbay] SUIIOA0)) JOOY . V,, SSB[D |  Sunsixyg 12064 V6
Spop SWpIng "y ) JO SUOBIA0ICY (©)e01209d | g
)M JUS)ISISUOD 9 0} S|l M Teays preoq umsdAn) 10] sjuswenmbay Suroelg [[epy SOJIPOIA J[qel
yuowaImbay] urexq uonepuno, o1 uondaoxy solO[e( |  Sumsixyg 1°S0+vd q+
S[[eA\ W2)S ATUOSEJA PROIOJUIAIUN) MO[[Y PInom ey} uondooxy saje[e | Sunsixyg 1 c0vry Vi
uononNSU0) MIN 10J sjustainbay] uoneoyIpojA [ong (V.100) MIN 9TLed fe
9L°ST DNOS TiM UONBUIPIOO)) UONUAAL] ddete(] Poo[] |  Bunsixy | 44%:! It
s1oquIMN SsaIppy 3uIpImg (VAD0) |  Sunsixg 16164 HE
WA Iop[uudg a1r,] 10§ Suidld azIg 03 ampaooid uonede) (VAD0) | Aued TTYCEIed D¢
sarouednoo() Sulfjom(q A[Twre,] g pue ] — sjuswarmnbay] welsAg 1opuudg a11,] onewoiny | Sunsixyg TE1€Y d€
sa1ourdnod() SSNOYUMO T, [EIIUSPISSY — SJUowoINbay woisAQ Iopuudg o1,y onewony | Sunsmxyg 'erey q€
SUOISIAIPqN MON (017084 dc
QUITT 107T-0I97 UIYITM J0UE)SI(] oI9S UoneIedsg a11,] JO UONonpal 0} paje[ai 9)oujoo,] 91971(] JIqe L.
TOT)ONISU0)) MIN 10 sjuatnaImbay] uonesypoA 190 (V.ID0) MIN 01106 €
siodep 10 sasen) ‘spmbr o1xo ] yim pueT IBaN I0 U0 JUdWIdo[oAd( (VADO) MIN 6'10€Y d¢
eI UBiso] SUIP[ME- AANENSTUIIPY MWVM :M%&E Ve
B3IV 911 SnopIezeH Jo uoniuga( (V.I00) MIN 0Ty V¢
$99,] UoT}0adsUIY — oAnRHSIUIWPY |  Sunsxyg $'601d dI
spsodo( — SARRNSIUIWDY | BunsIXg L8014 0]
JULISg MOYIIA JIOA 10J 99 UONERSNSIAU] — QANRISIUMIPY |  SunSIXy 9'801Y NI
SPUNJY 99 — SAURISIUIWPY |  3unsIXy ¢801Y W1
UOHEN[EA 103{014 JO UONBUIILISA( — QANRNSTUTPY |  Sunsixg £'801d 11
(uonnjosay 29,1 Sunsixy 1od) $99,] TULISJ — SATRISTUTWPY 3unsixy 80T M1
994 Surdew] JUSWNIO(] JO JUSWARJ — SANRNSIUTWPY |  Sunsixg $'901Y (1
99 09D UB[J JO JUSWARJ — SANBISTUIWIPY |  SunsIxy €901 IT
spodoy sTIog saxmbay - SANENSIUIIPY | SupsIXy 719014 HI
9J0 G a8eg
€10T °S 19quIsAoN
199y Arewruung

SIUSWPUIUIY [8907 JUOI[)) UBS
SOPOD) [PHUSPISY / U0LD) / SUIqUINI] / [eSTUBTISIA / [BOMOSTT / SUIPTING BIIIOJIED) €107

G416



20p°ATBUIUNS €107 SIUSpUSIE SUP[ING-TEUIASUOISIoA [euy - uondope spod £107\SuIp(ingy:1

SOWIOF] | SUNSIXT
PaIN}OBINUBIA pue sSUI[om(] AJIWe] 7 pue | Ul swaysAg 1opjundsg jo uoneressu] - 4€T VAAN (VID0) |  POGIPOA GEL NN Sl

solIo}g Jnog | Sumsixyq
Suipnjouy pue 0} dn sarouedndo() [eRUSPISTY UL SWSISAS JoPyuLIdS Jo uone([eIsu] — €[ VAAN (VAD0) |  POLIpoIn el VdIN S

sweysAg 1opuudg Jo vone(relsu] — £1 VAN (V400) wmm.wwww €1 VdIN vy
urel(J Wi0)§ I0/pUe J331)§ 0} PASAUO)) A[9ATOSIIH 9q 0} oFeurel(] Jooy 10 juswarmbey | Sunsixyg ¥ €06d as
$9BYS PUe SS[3UIS PAJeai], JUepIey-aI] |  Jupsixyg ¢ c06d D6
yuswarmbay SuLvA0) Jooy . V,, Sse[D) | Sunsixg 1'12064 g6
9 Jo 9 a8ed
€10T ‘G JoquioAoN
199U S Areurumg

SIUSWIPUSUIY [BO07] 9JUSWA[)) UBS
S9POD) [eNUSPISY / UsRID) / BUIqUIM|J / [eOTU™ " OJA] / TeOLI9]d / Burpmg BIwIofife) €107

241




Attachment — 2

Attachment “2”
Gh -/ 2~



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY
OF SAN CLEMENTE, CALIFORNIA, AMENDING
CHAPTERS 15.08, 15.12, 15.16, 15.20, 15.21, AND 15.22
OF TITLE 15 OF THE SAN CLEMENTE MUNICIPAL CODE
ADOPTING BUILDING REGULATIONS

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN CLEMENTE HEREBY ORDAINS AS

FOLLOWS:

Section 1.

amended to read in its entirety as follows:

Chapter 15.08 BUILDING CODE

15.08.010
15.08.020
15.08.025
15.08.030

15.08.035

15.08.040
15.08.050

15.08.060
15.08.070
15.08.080
15.08.090

15.08.100

Building Code Adopted — Where filed.

Division 1l of Chapter 1 amended — administration.
Chapter 2 amended — Definitions.

Chapter 4 amended — Special Detailed Requirements
Based on Use and Occupancy.

Chapter 7A amended — Materials and Construction
Methods for Exterior Wildfire Exposure.

Chapter 9 amended — Fire Protection Systems.
Chapter 15 amended — Roof Assemblies and Rooftop
Structures.

Chapter 18 amended — Soils and Foundations.
Chapter 31 amended — Special Construction.
Chapter 34 amended — Existing Structures.

Chapter 35 amended — Referenced Standards (NFPA
13, NFPA 13R, NFPA 13D, NFPA 14, NFPA 24).
Construction of Off-Street Parking Lots.

Section 15.08.010 Building Code Adopted — Where filed.

For the purpose of prescribing regulations for erection,
construction, enlargement, alteration, replacement, repair,
improvement, removal, movement, conversion, demolition,
use and occupancy, equipment, height, location,
maintenance, and areas of every building or structure or any
appurtenances connected or attached to such building or
structure in the City, the following construction codes,
subject to the modifications set forth in this Chapter, are
hereby adopted: California Building Code (CBC), 2013

Chapter 15.08 of the San Clemente Municipal Code is hereby

G4



Edition, based on the 2012 International Building Code as
published by the International Code Council, including
Appendix |; California Administrative Code, 2013 Edition;
California Energy Code, 2013 Edition; California Historical
Building Code, 2013 Edition; California Existing Building
Code, 2013 Edition; and California Referenced Standards
Code, 2013 Edition. The provisions of these codes, as
modified in this Chapter, shall constitute the building
regulations of the City. A copy of these codes is on file for
public examination in the City’s Building Division office.

15.08.020 Division Il of Chapter 1 amended —
Administration.

Division Il of Chapter 1of CBC is hereby amended as follows:

A. Subsection 101.1 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the
California Building Code of the State of California,
hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

B. Subsection 101.2 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

101.2 Scope. The provisions of this code shall apply
to the construction, alteration, movement,
enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use
and occupancy, location, maintenance, removal and
demolition of every building or structure or any
appurtenances connected or attached- to such
buildings or structures.

Exception: Detached one- and two-family
dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings
(townhouses) not more than three stories above
grade plane in height with a separate means of
egress and their accessory structures shall comply
with the California Residential Code.

The provisions of these codes shall apply to and
affect all of the territory of the City of San
Clemente, except work located primarily in a
public way, public utility towers and poles,

G4 M-



mechanical equipment not specifically regulated in
these codes, hydraulic flood control structures,
facilities for the production, generation, storage or
transmission of water or electrical energy by a
local agency, and except as exempted by these
codes.

Subsection 101.4. is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

101.4 Referenced codes. The other codes listed in
Sections 101.4.1 through 101.4.8 and referenced
elsewhere in this code shall be considered part of the
requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of
each such reference.

A new Subsection 101.4.7 is hereby added to Section
101 to read in its entirety as follows:

101.4.7 Electrical. The provisions of the California
Electrical Code shall apply to the installation,
alteration, repair and replacement of electrical wiring,
connections, fixtures and other devices and systems.

A new Subsection 101.4.8 is hereby added to Section
101 to read in its entirety as follows:

101.4.8 Green Code. The provisions of the California
Green Building Standards Code shall apply to design
and construction of buildings for sustainability.

Subsection 105.2 is hereby amended by deleting
items 1 through 13 under the heading “Building” and
replacing them with the following:

Building:

1. One-story detached accessory buildings used as
tool and storage sheds, playhouses and similar
uses and structures such as portable shade cloth
structures, provided the floor area does not
exceed 120 square feet (11 m?. Such structures
must comply with the setback and height
requirements of the City Zoning Ordinance and the
Fire Code.

i



2. Fences not over 6 feet high.
3. Oil derricks.

4. Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet in height
measured from the bottom of footing to the top of
wall unless supporting a surcharge or impounding
Class I, li or HIA liquids.

5. Water tanks supported directly onh grade if the
capacity does not exceed 5,000 gallons and the
ratio of height to diameter or width does not
exceed 2:1.

6. Detached decks, platforms or similar structures
not exceeding 200 square feet in area, walkways,
sidewalks and driveways that are not more than
30 inches (762mm) above adjacent grade, and not
over any basement or story below, and are not
part of a required exit means of egress, and are
not part of an accessible route.

7. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets,
counter tops and similar finish work that does not
involve electrical, mechanical or plumbing work.

8. Temporary motion picture, television and theater
stage sets and scenery.

9. Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a
Group R-3 occupancy that are less than 18 inches
deep, do not exceed 5,000 gallons and are
installed entirely above ground.

10.Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or
agricultural purposes, not including service
systems.

11.Swings and other playground equipment
accessory to detached one- and two-family
dwellings.

12.Window awnings supported by an exterior wall
that do not project more than 54 inches from the
exterior wall and do not require additional support
of Group R-3 and U occupancies.

Lt~



13.Nonfixed and movable fixtures, cases, racks,
counters and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches in
height.

14.Radio and television antenna, and flagpoles not
over twelve (12) feet in height measured from
grade.

Unless otherwise exempted, separate plumbing,
electrical and mechanical permits will be required for
the above-exempted items.

Subsection 105.3.2 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

105.3.2 Time limitation of application. An
application for a permit for any proposed work shall
be deemed to have been abandoned 360 days after
the date of filing, unless such application has been
pursued in good faith or permit has been issued,
except that the building official is authorized to grant
one or more extensions of time for additional periods
not exceeding 90 days each. The extension shall be
requested in writing and justifiable cause
demonstrated. The total period of application
extensions granted shall not exceed an additional 18
months. In order to renew action on an application
after expiration, the applicant shall resubmit plans and
pay a new plan check fee.

Subsection 105.5 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued shall become
invalid unless the work on the site authorized by such
permit is commenced within 180 days after its
issuance, or if the work authorized on the site by such
permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180
days after the time the work commenced.

Any permittee holding an unexpired permit may apply
for an extension of the time within which work may
commence under that permit when the permittee is
unable to commence work within the time required.
The extension shall be requested in writing prior to
the permit expiring and show justifiable cause

il



demonstrating that circumstances beyond the control
of the permittee have prevented action from being
taken. Pursuant to this paragraph, the Building
Official or his/her designee is authorized to grant, in
writing, one extension of time, for a period not more
than 180 days. The completion of construction shall
not extend beyond the timeframes mandated in
Section 105.8 of this code even with such extension.

Before such work can be recommenced after a permit
expires, a new permit shall first be obtained, and a fee
therefore shall be one half the amount required for a
new permit for such work, provided no changes have
been made or will be made in the original plans and
specifications for such work, and provided further that
such suspension or abandonment has not exceeded
one year. In order to renew action on a permit after
this one year time period, the permittee shall pay a
new full permit fee.

A new Subsection 105.8 is hereby added to Section
105 to read in its entirety as follows:

105.8 Completion of construction. Notwithstanding
subsection 105.5 above, all construction shall be
completed by the owner, owner's agent, or the
permittee and approved by the City within the
following time frame:

a. New residential buildings construction . . . 24 months

b. Residential room additions and remodels . . .

12 months

Tenant improvements . . . 12 months
Pools/spas . .. 12 months

Patio covers and similar structures . . . 6 months
Fences and/or retaining walls . . . 6 months

6 months
All other minor alterations . . . 6 months

> @meoo

Upon written request of the owner or permittee, the
Building  Official and/or  his/her  designated
representative may extend the period for completion
of construction for a period not to exceed one
hundred eighty (180) days. The written request must
demonstrate that (1) due to circumstances beyond the
owner's or permittee's control, construction could not
be completed in the required construction period; (2)

Water heaters, water softeners, and air conditioners . . .

54 /8



that reasonable progress has been made; (3) that the
condition of the property presents no health or safety
hazard; and (4) that the continued delay will not
create any unreasonable visual or physical detriment
to the neighborhood. Any extension beyond one
hundred eighty (180) days must be approved by the
City Manager.

The requirement of this subsection shall apply to all
construction projects undertaken prior to the effective
date of this subsection except that the construction
period set forth shall run from the effective date of'
this subsection rather than from the date construction
was commenced or a building permit was issued for
the project.

A new Subsection 105.9 is hereby added to Section
105 to read in its entirety as follows.

105.9 Maintenance of  property during
construction. During construction, all property shall
be maintained in a reasonably clean and well-kept
manner. All lumber and building materials shall be
neatly piled or stacked in a safe manner and stored in
the rear yard of the residential property or inside the
building construction perimeter, except that building
materials may be stored in a front yard for a period
not to exceed thirty (30) days. A waiver of this
requirement may be obtained from the Building
Official or his/her designated representative if the
construction is screened from view from adjacent
occupied or public property with fencing materials
approved by city zoning and building regulations.

A new Subsection 107.2.6 is hereby added to Section
107 to read in its entirety as follows:

107.2.6 Soil report. A Soil report shall be submitted
with all permit applications for new construction and
additions.  Soil Reports shall be prepared by a
professional engineer licensed by the State to prepare
such reports. The Building Official may waive this
requirement if he/she finds that the scope of work
applied for does not necessitate a soil report.

Subsection 107.3 is hereby amended to add a second
paragraph that reads as follows:

Zadd|



When submittal documents are required by Section
107.1, a plan review fee shall be paid at the time of
submitting the submittal documents for plan review.
Said plan review fees are separate fees from the
permit fees specified in Section 109.2 and are in
addition to the permit fees. Said plan review fee shall
be as set forth in the City Council Fee Resolution.

Subsection 107.5 is hereby amended to add a second
paragraph that reads as follows:

The approved plans, permit application, inspection
card and other construction documents required by
the Building Official shall be imaged after the final
inspection and will be a permanent record in the City.
The applicant shall pay the cost of imaging at the time
of permit.

Subsection 109.2 is hereby amended by adding a
sentence at the end to read as follows:

The fee for each permit shall be as set forth in the
City Council Fee Resolution unless otherwise
specified by the code.

Subsection 109.3 is hereby amended to add a second
paragraph that reads as follows:

The Building Official shall make the determination of
value or valuation under any provisions of this code.
The valuation shall be determined by using rational
methods established by the Building Official that
reasonably establish the construction value or the
contract price of the actual construction cost. The
value of work to be used in computing the Building
Permit and Building Plan Review fees shall be the
total value of all construction work for which the
permit is issued, as well as all finish work, painting,
roofing, electrical, plumbing, heating, air conditioning,
elevators, fire extinguishing systems and any other
permanent equipment.

Subsection 109.4 is hereby amended to add a second
paragraph that reads as follows:

7530



An investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, shall
be collected whether or not a permit is then or
subsequently issued. The investigation fee shall be
equal to the amount of the permit fee required by this
code. The payment of such investigation fee shall not
exempt any person from compliance with all other
provisions of this code nor from any penalty
prescribed by law.

Subsection 109.6 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

109.6 Refunds. The building official is authorized to
establish a refund policy. The building official may
authorize refunding of any fee paid hereunder which
was erroneously paid or collected as provided below.

The building official may authorize refunding of not
more than 80 percent of the permit fee paid when no
work has been done under a permit issued in
accordance with this code.

The building official may authorize refunding of not
more than 80 percent of the plan review fee paid
when an application for a permit for which a plan
review has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before
any plan reviewing is done.

The building official shall not authorize refunding of
any fee paid except on written application filed by the
original permittee not later than 180 days after the
date of payment.

A new Subsection 109.7 is hereby added to Section
109 to read in its entirety as follows:

109.7 Deposit. The Building Official may require a
deposit from the applicant for a certain project or work
in order to secure the request of final inspection
approvals from the applicant or the repairing of
damaged City properties during the period of
construction. The deposit money will be refunded to
the applicant when the final inspections are approved
or the damages are repaired to the satisfaction of the
City. The deposit amount shall not be more than
twice the permit fee.

Za



A new Subsection 110.7 is hereby added to Section
110 to read in its entirety as follows:

110.7 Reinspections. A reinspection fee may be
assessed for each inspection or reinspection when
such portion of work for which an inspection is
requested is not complete or when previous
corrections are not corrected.

This subsection is not to be interpreted as requiring
reinspection fees the first time a job is rejected for
failure to comply with requirements of this Code, but
as controlling the practice of calling for inspections
before the job is ready for such inspection or
reinspection.

Reinspection fees may be assessed when the
inspection record card is not posted or otherwise
made available on the work site, or when the
approved plans are not readily available to the
inspector, or for failure to provide access on the date
for which inspection is requested.

To obtain a reinspection, the applicant shall pay the
reinspection fee as established by the City Council
Fee Resolution. In instances where reinspection
fees have been assessed, no additional inspection of
work will be performed until the required reinspection
fees have been paid.

15.08.025 Chapter 2 amended — Definitions.

Chapter 2 of CBC is hereby amended as follows:

A.

The Definition of “High-rise structure” in Subsection 202
is hereby amended to read as follows:

HIGH-RISE STRUCTURE. Every building of any type
of construction or occupancy having floors used for
human occupancy located more than 55 above the
lowest floor level having building access (see Section
403), except buildings used as hospitals as defined in
the Health and Safety Code Section 1250.

10



The Definition of “Swimming Pool” in Subsection 202 is
hereby amended to read as follows:

SWIMMING POOL. Any structure intended for
swimming, recreational bathing or wading that
contains water over 18 inches deep. This includes in-
ground, above-ground and on-ground pools; hot tubs;
spas and fixed-in-place wading pools.

Subsection 202 is hereby amended by adding the
following definitions:

APPROACH-DEPARTURE PATH. The flight path of
the helicopter as it approaches or departs from the
landing pad.

EMERGENCY HELICOPTER LANDING FACILITY
(EHLF). A landing area on the roof of a building that is
not intended to function as a heliport or helistop but is
capable of accommodating fire or medical helicopters
engaged in emergency operations.

SAFETY AREA. A defined area surrounding the
landing pad which is free of obstructions.

TAKEOFF AND LANDING AREA. The combination
of the landing pad centered within the surrounding
safety area.

15.08.030 Chapter 4 amended — Special Detailed
Requirements Based on Use and Occupancy.

Chapter 4 of CBC is hereby amended as follows:

A

The title of Section 403 is hereby amended to read as
follows:

SECTION 403
HIGH-RISE BUILDINGS AND GROUP [|-2
OCCUPANCIES HAVING OCCUPIED FLOORS
LOCATED MORE THAN 55 FEET ABOVE THE
LOWEST LEVEL OF FIRE DEPARTMENT VEHICLE
ACCESS

11

G773



The first paragraph of Subsection 403.1 is hereby
amended to read as follows:

403.1 Applicability. New high-rise buildings and
Group 1-2 having occupied floors located more than
55 feet above the lowest level of fire department
vehicle access and new Group [|-2 occupancies
having occupied floors located more than 55 feet
above the lowest level of fire department vehicle
access shall comply with Sections 403.2 through
403.6. (Balance of the subsection to remain
unchanged)

The first paragraph of Subsection 406.3.3 is hereby
amended to read as follows:

406.3.3 Garages and carports. Carports shall be
open on at least two sides. Garage and carport floor
surfaces shall be of approved noncombustible
material. Carports not open on at least two sides
shall be considered a garage and shall comply with
the provisions of this section for garages. (Balance of
the section to remain unchanged)

Subsection 406.4.5 is hereby amended by deleting
exception no. 1 and amending the second paragraph
to read as follows:

The area of floor used for parking of automobiles or
other vehicles shall be sloped to facilitate the
movement of liquids to a drain or toward the main
vehicle entry doorway with an approved oil separator
or trap discharging to sewers in accordance with the
California Plumbing Code.

Subsection 412.7 is hereby amended by adding
Sections 412.7.6 through 412.7.6.13 as follows:

412.7.6. Emergency Helicopter Landing Facility.
Emergency Helicopter Landing Facility (EHLF) shall
be constructed as specified in Section 412.7.6.1
through 412.7.6.13.

412.7.6.1 General. Every building of any type of
construction or occupancy having floors used for

12



human occupancy located more than 75 ft above
the lowest level of the fire department vehicle
access shall have a rooftop emergency helicopter
landing facility (EHLF) in a location approved by
the fire code official for use by fire, police, and
emergency medical helicopters only.

412.7.6.2 Rooftop Landing Pad. The landing
pad shall be 50 ft. x 50 ft. or a 50 ft. diameter circle
that is pitched or sloped to provide drainage away
from access points and passenger holding areas
at a slope of 0.5 percent to 2 percent. The landing
pad surface shall be constructed of approved non-
combustible, nonporous materials. It shall be
capable of supporting a helicopter with a
maximum gross weight of 15,000 Ibs. For
structural design requirements, see California
Building Code.

412.7.6.3 Approach-Departure Path. The
emergency helicopter landing facility shall have
two approach-departure paths separated in plan
from each other by at least 90 degrees. No objects
shall penetrate above the approach-departure
paths. The approach-departure path begins at the
edge of the landing pad, with the same width or
diameter as the landing pad and is a rising slope
extending outward and upward at a ratio of eight
feet horizontal distance for every one foot of
vertical height.

412.7.6.4 Safety Area. The safety area is a
horizontal plane level with the landing pad surface
and shall extend 25 ft in all directions from the
edge of the landing pad. No objects shall
penetrate above the plane of the safety area.

412.7.6.5 Safety Net. If the rooftop landing pad
is elevated more than 30 in. (2'-6") above the
adjoining surfaces, a 6 ft in wide horizontal safety
net capable of supporting 25 Ibs/psf shall be
provided around the perimeter of the landing pad.
The inner edge of the safety net attached to the
landing pad shall be slightly dropped (greater than
5 in. but less than 18 in.) below the pad elevation.
The safety net shall slope upward but the outer

13

Ih2



safety net edge shall not be above the elevation of
the landing pad.

412.7.6.6 Take-off and Landing Area. The
takeoff and landing area shall be free of
obstructions and 100 ft x 100 ft. or 100 ft.
diameter.

412.7.6.7 Wind Indicating Device. An approved
wind indicating device shall be provided but shall
not extend into the safety area or the approach-
departure paths.

412.7.6.8 Special Markings. The emergency
helicopter landing facility shall be marked as
indicated in Figure 412.7.6.8.

412.7.6.9 EHLF Exits. Two stairway exits shall be
provided from the landing platform area to the roof
surface. For landing areas less than 2,501 square
feet in area, the second exit may be a fire escape
or ladder leading to the roof surface below. The
stairway from the landing facility platform to the
floor below shall comply with Section 1009.7.2 for
riser height and tread depth. Handrails shall be
provided, but shall not extend above the platform
surface.

412.7.6.10 Standpipe systems. The standpipe
system shall be extended to the roof level on
which the EHLF is located. All portions of the
EHLF area shall be within 150 feet of a 2.5-inch
outlet on a Class | or |ll standpipe.

412.7.6.11 Fire extinguishers. A minimum of one
portable fire extinguisher having a minimum 80-
B:C rating shall be provided and located near the
stairways or ramp to the landing pad. The fire
extinguisher cabinets shall not penetrate the
approach-departure paths, or the safety area.
Installation, inspection, and maintenance of
extinguishers shall be in accordance with
California Fire Code Section 906.

412.7.6.13 EHLF. Fueling, maintenance, repairs,
or storage of helicopters shall not be permitted.

14

BT



20’ Inside Diameter
2’ Line Widt
Red in Color -

50’

Address Numbers:
5’ High, 1’ Line Width
Black in Color

\_.12345

l¢

Figure 412.7.6.8 Helicopter Landing Pad Markings

Numbers:
10’ High

2’ Line Width
Red in Color

Touchdown

Pad Boundary

17 in Width —™=a
Red in Color

B 50’

. The preferred background is white or tan.

v

. The circled, red numbers indicate the allowable weight that the facility is capable

of supporting in thousands of pounds.

. The numbers shall be oriented towards the preferred flight (typically facing the

prevailing wind).

15.08.035 Chapter 7A amended — Materials and
Construction Methods for Exterior Wildfire Exposure.

Chapter 7A of CBC is hereby amended as follows:

15

Zaal



Subsection 710A.3.2 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

710A.3.2 Detached accessory structures within 50
feet of an applicable building shall comply with the
requirements of this section.

Subsection 710A.4 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

710A.4 Requirements. Accessory structures shall be
constructed of non-combustible or ignition-resistant
materials.

15.08.040 Chapter 9 amended — Fire Protection
Systems.

Chapter 9 of CBC is hereby amended as follows:

A

Subsection 903.2 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler
systems in buildings and structures shall be provided
in the locations described in this section and in
Section 903.2 of the California Fire Code as amended
by the City of San Clemente when one of the
following conditions exists:

1. New buildings: In addition to the requirements of
section 903.2.1 through 903.2.19, approved
automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and
structures shall be provided as follows (Exception:
Group R Detached one- two-family dwellings and
townhouses as required by section 903.2.8):

i) Throughout all Groups A, |, E, and H
Occupancies

ii) Throughout all Group B, F, M, and S
Occupancies exceeding 1,000 square feet

iilThroughout all Group U-1 Occupancies
exceeding 6,000 square feet

For the purposes of this section, fire walls shall not
define separate buildings.

16

77 A8



2. Alteration: When the floor area of the Alteration

within any two-year period exceeds 75% of area of
the existing structure and the alteration includes
structural modifications other than seismic
upgrade.

Addition: Sprinkler protection shall be provided
throughout the entire building when:

1. Existing unsprinklered building less than
5,000 ft% where 20% or more is added and
the gross floor areas exceed 5,000 square
feet.

2. Existing unsprinklered building equal or
greater than 5,000 ft>: where more than
1,000 ft* is added.

3. Fire sprinklers shall be provided in additions
to an existing building that has fire
sprinklers installed.

Subsection 903.2.8 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

903.2.8 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system
installed in accordance with Subsection 903.3 of
Section 903 of this code and Subsection 903.3 of
Section 903 of the California Fire Code as amended
by the City of San Clemente shall be provided
throughout all buildings with a Group R fire area as
follows:

1.

2.

All new Group R occupancies, including the
attached garages

All existing Group R occupancies and U-1
garages when the total floor area is increase by
50% of the existing area over a 2-year period

All existing Group R occupancies and U-1
garages when the total area is increased by 750
square feet or more over a 2-year period

All existing Group R occupancies and U-1
garages when an additional story is added to the
structure regardless of the area involved

An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed
throughout any existing Group R Occupancy
building when the floor area of the Alteration or
Combination of an Addition and Alteration, within
any two year period, is 50% or more of area of

17

G- 2



the existing structure and where the scope of the
work exposes building framing and facilitates
sprinkler installation and is such that the
Building/Fire Code Official determines that the
complexity of installing a sprinkler system would
be similar as in a new building.

. Any addition to existing building that has fire

sprinklers installed.

Exceptions:

1.

Existing Group R-3 occupancies converted to
Group R-3.1 occupancies not housing
bedridden clients, not housing nonambulatory
clients above the first floor and not housing
clients above the second floor.

Existing Group R-3 occupancies converted to
Group R-3.1 occupancies housing only one
bedridden client and complying with CBC
Section 425.8.3.3.

Pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section
13113 occupancies housing ambulatory
children only, none of whom are mentally ill or
mentally retarded, and the buildings or portions
thereof in which such children are housed are
not more than two stories in height, and
buildings or portions thereof housing such
children have an automatic fire alarm system
activated by approved smoke detectors.
Pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section
13143.6 occupancies licensed for protective
social care which house ambulatory clients
only, none of whom is a child (under the age of
18 years), or who is elderly (65 years of age or
over).

When not used in accordance with Section 504.2 or

506.3, an automatic sprinkler system installed in

accordance with Section 903.3.1.2 shall be allowed in

Group R-2.1 occupancies.
An automatic sprinkler system designed in

accordance with Section 903.3.1.3 shall not be
utilized in Group R-2.1 or R-4 occupancies.

18

7G50



C.

A new Subsection 903.3.5.3 is hereby added to
Section 903 to read in its entirety as follows:

903.3.5.3 Hydraulically calculated systems. The
design of hydraulically calculated fire sprinkler
systems shall not exceed 90% of the water supply
capacity

Exception: When static pressure exceeds 100 psi,
and required by the Fire Code Official, the fire
sprinkler system shall not exceed water supply
capacity specified by Table 903.3.5.3

TABLE 903.3.5.3
Hydraulically Calculated Systems

Design %
75— //,
80— /
//
1Y . P
//’
I s 1 [
160 110G 120 130 140 150 PS!

Subsection 903.4 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

903.4 Sprinkler system supervision and alarms. All
valves controlling the water supply for automatic
sprinkler systems, pumps, tanks, water levels and
temperatures, critical air pressures and water-flow
switches on all sprinkler systems shall be electrically
supervised by a listed fire alarm control unit.

Exceptions:
1. Automatic sprinkler systems protecting one-
and two-family dwellings.

2. Limited area systems serving fewer than 20
sprinklers.

19

27-31



3. Jockey pump control valves that are sealed or
locked in the open position.

4. Valves controlling the fuel supply to fire pump
engines that are sealed or locked in the open
position.

5. Trim valves to pressure switches in dry,
preaction and deluge sprinkler systems that
are sealed or locked in the open position.

Subsection 905.4 is hereby amended by adding
location no. 7 as follows:

7. The centerline of the 2.5 inches (64 mm) outlet
shall be no less than 18 inches (457 mm) above
and no more than 24 inches (610 mm) above the
finished floor.

Subsection 907.2.13 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

907.2.13 High-rise buildings and Group I-2
occupancies having floors located more than 55
feet above the lowest level fire department vehicle
access. High-rise buildings and Group |2
occupancies having occupied floors located more
than 55 feet above the lowest level of fire department
vehicle access shall be provided with an automatic
smoke detection in accordance with Section
907.2.13.1, a fire department communication system
in accordance with Section 907.2.13.2 and an
emergency voice/alarm communication system in
accordance with Section 907.5.2.2

Exceptions:

1. Airport traffic control towers in accordance with
Section 907.2.22 and Section 412 of the
California Building Code.

2. Open parking garages in accordance with
Section 406.5 of the California Building Code.

3. Buildings with an occupancy in Group A-5 in
accordance with Section 303.6 of the California
Building Code.

4. Low-hazard special occupancies in accordance
with Section 503.1.1 of the California Building
Code.

20

FH- 25



5. In Group |-2 and R-2.1 occupancies, the alarm
shall sound at a constantly attended location
and general occupant notification shall be
broadcast by the emergency voice/alarm
communication system

G. Subsection 907.3.1 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

907.3.1 Duct smoke detectors. Smoke detectors
installed in ducts shall be listed for the air velocity,
temperature and humidity present in the duct. Duct
smoke detectors shall be connected to the building’s
fire alarm control unit when a fire alarm system is
installed. Activation of a duct smoke detector shall
initiate a visible and audible supervisory signal at a
constantly attended location and shall perform the
intended fire safety function in accordance with this
code and the California Mechanical Code. Duct
smoke detectors shall not be used as a substitute for
required open area detection.

Exception: In occupancies not required to be
equipped with a fire alarm system, actuation of a
smoke detector shall activate a visible and an
audible signal in an approved location. Smoke
detector trouble conditions shall activate a visible
or audible signal in an approved location and shall
be identified as air duct detector trouble.

H. Subsection 907.5.2.2 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows.

907.5.2.2 Emergency voice/alarm
communication system. Emergency voice/alarm
communication system required by this code shall
be designed and installed in accordance with
NFPA 72. The operation of any automatic fire
detector, sprinkler waterflow device or manual fire
alarm box shall automatically sound an alert tone
followed by voice instructions giving approved
information and directions for a general or staged
evacuation in accordance with the building’s fire
safety and evacuation plans required by Section
404 of California Fire Code. In high-rise buildings
and Group |-2 occupancies having occupied floors

) ?/fﬁ 3



located more than 55 feet above the lowest level
of fire department vehicle access, the system shall
operate on a minimum of the alarming floor, the
floor above and the floor below. Speakers shall be
provided throughout the building by paging zones.
At a minimum, paging zones shall be provided as
follows:

Elevator groups.

Exit stairways.

Each floor.

Areas of refuge as defined in Section
1002.1.

Dwelling Units in apartment houses.

Hotel guest rooms or suites.

sl R

o o

Exception: In Group |-2 and R-2.1 occupancies,
the alarm shall sound in a constantly attended
area and a general occupant notification shall be
broadcast over the overhead page.

Subsection 907.6.3.2 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

907.6.3.2 High-rise buildings. High-rise buildings
and Group 1-2 occupancies having occupied floors
located more than 55 feet above the lowest level of
fire department vehicle access, a separate zone by
floor shall be provided for all of the following types of
alarm-initiating devices where provided:

Smoke detectors.

Sprinkler water-flow devices.

Manual fire alarm boxes

Other approved types of automatic detection
devices or suppression systems.

HPON=

Subsection 907.6.5 is hereby amended to read as
follows:

907.6.5 Monitoring. Fire alarm systems required by
this chapter or by the California Fire Code shall be
monitored by an approved supervising station in
accordance with NFPA 72, this section, and per
Orange County Fire Authority Guideline “New and
Existing Fire Alarm & Signaling Systems”. (Balance
of the subsection to remain unchanged)

22

G394



15.08.050 Chapter 15 amended — Roof Assemblies and
Rooftop Structures.

Chapter 15 of CBC is hereby amended as follows:

A.

a.

Subsection 1503.4 is hereby amended by adding a
second paragraph to read as follows:

Water that accumulates on a roof shall be effectively
drained and conveyed from the roof to a storm drain,
street gutter, or other locations approved by the
Building Official. Such water shall be conveyed
through gutters, leaders, associated piping or other
non-erodible surface drainage devices as approved
by the Building Official. For any minor or small roofs,
the Building Official may exempt this requirement.

Table 1505.1 in Subsection 1505.1 is hereby
amended to read as follows:

TABLE 1505.1°
MINIMUM ROOF COVERING CLASSIFICATION
FOR TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION

IA[IB[NIA[HB]|INIA|NB]| IV |VA | VB

AlA|IAIA|IATA]JAIALA

Unless otherwise required in accordance with Chapter 7A

Subsections 1505.1.1, 1505.1.2, 1505.1.3 are hereby
deleted and replaced with a new Subsection 1505.1.1
to read in its entirety as follows:

1505.1.1 Roof Coverings. The roof covering or
roofing assembly on any new structure regulated by
this code shall be Class A fire retardant roof minimum
as classified in CBC Section 1505.2. Non-
combustible roof covering may be applied in
accordance with the manufacturer's requirements in
lieu of a fire retardant roofing assembly. Wood
roofing materials are prohibited unless pressure
treated and approved for fire retardant of Class A
minimum. For existing structure when ten percent
(10%) or more of the total roof area is re-roofed within
any one-year period, shall have a Class A fire
retardant roof covering for entire roof area. For
existing structure when less than ten percent (10%) of
the total roof area is re-roofed within any one-year
period, shall have a fire retardant roof covering class

23



equal to or greater than the existing roof covering and
not less than Class B.

15.08.060 Chapter 18 amended — Soils and Foundations.

Chapter 18 of CBC is hereby amended as follows:

A.

Subsection 1807.1.6 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

1807.1.6 Prescriptive design of concrete and
masonry foundation walls. Concrete and masonry
foundation walls that are laterally supported at the top
and bottom shall be permitted to be designed and
constructed in accordance with this section.
Prescriptive design of foundation walls shall not be
used for structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category D, E or F.

15.08.070 Chapter 31 amended — Special Construction.

Chapter 31 of CBC is hereby amended as follows:

A

The first sentence of Subsection 3109.3 is hereby
amended to read as follows:

3109.3 Public swimming pools. Public swimming
pools shall be completely enclosed by a fence at least
5 feet in height or a screen enclosure. (Balance of
the section tfo remain unchanged.)

The first sentence of Subsection 3109.4.1 is hereby
amended to read as follows:

3109.4.1 Barrier height and clearances. The top of
the barrier shall be at least 60 inches above grade
measured on the side of the barrier that faces away
from the swimming pool. (Balance of the section to
remain unchanged)

Subsection 3109.4.4.1 is hereby amended by adding
the following definition:

PRIVATE POOL means any constructed pool,
permanent or portable, which is intended for non-

24

74-3%



commercial use as a swimming pool by not more than
three owner families and their guests.

The first sentence of Subsection 3109.4.4.3 is hereby
amended to read as follows:

3109.4.4.3 Enclosure; required characteristics. An
enclosure shall have all of the following
characteristics and shall comply with provisions
contained in 3109.4:

(Balance of the section to remain unchanged)

A new Subsection 3109.7 is hereby added to Section
3109 to read as follows:

3109.7 Sound Attenuation. Filters, heating systems,
and pumps installed to serve pool, spa, hot tub,
waterfall or any body of water, shall be enclosed and
soundproofed. An acoustical report prepared by a
licensed or approved acoustical professional can be
used to substitute for sound wall enclosures as long
as the report demonstrates the compliance of the
requirements specified in Chapter 8.48 of the San
Clemente Municipal Code.

15.08.080 Chapter 34 amended — Existing Structures.

Chapter 34 of CBC is hereby amended as follows:

A.

New Subsections 3410.2 and 3410.3 are hereby
added to Section 3410 to read as follows:

3410.2 Requirements. It shall be unlawful for any
person to move any house, building or structure of
any kind or description, except fabricated structures
approved by the Building Official, from any point
outside of the City limits of the City, onto any property
or lot within the City limits of the City of San
Clemente. No building or structure shall be moved or
relocated until such building or structure is approved
by the Planning Commission under a Conditional Use
Permit. A permit to relocate the building or structure,
issued by the Building Official to the owner of the
premises to which the particular building or structure
is proposed to be moved, is also required.

25

7#-37



3410.3 Relocation Permit Fee. Before any
application for a Relocation Permit is accepted for
filing, a fee as set forth in the City Council Fee
Resolution shall be paid by the applicant to the City of
San Clemente to cover City’s cost for the investigation
of the condition of the building to be moved and the
inspection of the proposed new location. The
application fee herein provided for shall be in addition
to the building permit fee required by this code and
any other fee or charge required by law or ordinance
where a main building and building accessory thereto
are to be moved.

15.08.090 Chapter 35 amended — Referenced
Standards (NFPA 13, NFPA 13R, NFPA 13D, NFPA 14,
NFPA 24).

The Referenced Standards in Chapter 35 of CBC are hereby
amended as follows:

A. NFPA 13, 2013 Edition, Installation of Sprinkler
Systems is hereby amended as follows:

1. Section 6.8.3 is hereby revised to read in its
entirety as follows:

6.8.3 Fire department connections (FDC) shall
be of an approved type. The FDC shall contain
a minimum of two 2 %” inlets. The location
shall be approved and be no more than 150
feet from a public hydrant. The FDC may be
located within 150 feet of a private fire hydrant
when approved by the fire code official. The
size of piping and the number of inlets shall be
approved by the fire code official. If acceptable
to the water authority, it may be installed on the
backflow assembly. Fire department inlet
connections shall be painted OSHA safety red.
When the fire sprinkler density design requires
500 gpm (including inside hose stream
demand) or greater, or a standpipe system is
included, four 2 %" inlets shall be provided.

26

Zati 1



Section 8.3.3.1 is hereby revised to read in its
entirety as follows:

8.3.3.1. When fire sprinkler systems are
installed in shell buildings of undetermined use
(Spec Buildings) other than warehouses (S
occupancies), fire sprinklers of the quick-
response type shall be used. Use is considered
undetermined if a specific tenant/occupant is
not identified at the time the fire sprinkler plan
is submitted. Sprinklers in light hazard
occupancies shall be one of the following:

a) Quick-response type as defined in

3.64.7.

b) Residential sprinklers in accordance with
the requirements of 8.4.5.

c) Standard-response sprinklers used for

modifications or additions to existing light
hazard systems equipped with standard-
response sprinklers.

d) Standard-response  sprinklers  used
where individual standard-response
sprinklers are replaced in existing light
hazard systems.

Section 8.17.1.1.1 is hereby added as follows:

8.17.1.1.1 Residential Waterflow Alarms. A
local water-flow alarm shall be provided on all
sprinkler systems and shall be connected to
the building fire alarm or water-flow monitoring
system, where provided. Group R
occupancies not requiring a fire alarm system
by the California Fire Code shall be provided
with a minimum of one approved interior alarm
device in each unit. Interior alarm devices
shall be required to provide 55 dBA or 15 dBA
above ambient, whichever is greater,
throughout all living spaces within each unit.
Sound levels in all sleeping areas with all
intervening doors closed shall be a minimum of
15 dBA above the average ambient sound
level but not less than 75 dBA, whichever is
greater. When not connected to a fire alarm or
water-flow monitoring system, audible devices

27

7H-37



shall be powered from an uninterruptible circuit
(except for over-current protection) serving
normally operated appliances in the residence.

Section 11.1.1.2 is hereby added as follows:

11.1.1.2 When fire sprinkler systems are required in
buildings of undetermined use other than
warehouses, they shall be designed and installed to
have a fire sprinkler density of not less than that
required for an Ordinary Hazard Group 2 use, with
no reduction(s) in density or design area.
Warehouse fire sprinkler systems shall be designed
to Figure 16.2.1.3.2 (d) curve “G’. Use is
considered undetermined if a specific
tenant/occupant is not identified at the time the
sprinkler plan is submitted. Where a subsequent
occupancy requires a system with greater
capability, it shall be the responsibility of the
occupant to upgrade the system to the required
density for the new occupancy.

Section 11.2.3.1.1.1 is hereby added as
follows:

11.2.3.1.1.1 The available water supply for fire
sprinkler system design shall be determined by
one of the following methods, as approved by
the Fire Code Official:

1) Subtract the project site elevation from the
low water level for the appropriate
pressure zone and multiply the result by
0.433;

2) Use a maximum of 40 psi, if available;

3) Utilize the Orange County Fire Authority
water-flow test form/directions to document
a flow test conducted by the local water
agency or an approved third party licensed
in the State of California

Section 23.2.1.1 is hereby revised to read in its
entirety as follows:

23.2.1.1 Where a waterflow test is used for the
purposes of system design, the test shall be
conducted no more than 6 months prior to

28

7745



working plan submittal unless otherwise
approved by the authority having jurisdiction.

NFPA 13R 2013 Edition Installation of Sprinkler
System in Residential Occupancies up to and
Including Four Stories in Height is hereby amended
as follows:

1.

Section 6.16.1 is hereby revised to read in its
entirety as follows:

6.16.1 A local water-flow alarms shall be
provided on all sprinkler systems and shall be
connected to the building fire alarm or water-
flow monitoring system where provided. Group
R occupancies containing less than the
number of stories, dwelling units or occupant
load specified in the California Fire Code as
requiring a fire alarm system shall be provided
with a minimum of one approved interior alarm
device in each unit. Interior alarm devices
shall be required to provide 55 dBA or 15 dBA
above ambient, whichever is greater,
throughout all living spaces within each
dwelling unit. Sound levels in all sleeping areas
with all intervening doors closed shall be a
minimum of 15 dBA above the average
ambient sound level but not less than 75 dBA,
whichever is greater. When not connected to a
fire alarm or water-flow monitoring system,
audible devices shall be powered from an
uninterruptible circuit (except for over-current
protection)  serving normally  operated
appliances in the residence.

There shall also be a minimum of one exterior
alarm indicating device, listed for outside
service and audible from the access roadway
that serves that building.

NFPA 13D 2013 Edition Installation of Sprinkler

Systems in One and Two-Family Dwellings and

Manufactured Homes is hereby amended as follows:

1.

Section 7.1.2 is hereby revised to read in its
entirety as follows:

29

Za4



7.1.2 The system piping shall not have a
separate control valve unless supervised by a
central station, proprietary or remote station
alarm service.

Section 7.6 is hereby deleted in its entirety and
replaced as follows:

7.6 Alarms. Exterior alarm indicating device
shall be listed for outside service and audible
from the street from which the house is
addressed. Exterior audible devices shall be
placed on the front or side of the structure and
the location is subject to final approval by the
fire code official. Additional interior alarm
devices shall be required to provide 55 dBA or
15 dBA above ambient, whichever is greater,
throughout all living spaces. Sound levels in all
sleeping areas with all intervening doors closed
shall be a minimum of 15 dBA above the
average ambient sound level but not less than
75 dBA, whichever is greater. Audible devices
shall be powered from an uninterruptible circuit
(except for over-current protection) serving
normally operated appliances in the residence.

Exceptions:

1. When an approved water flow monitoring
system is installed, interior audible
devices may be powered through the fire
alarm control panel.

2. When smoke detectors specified under
CBC Section 907.2.11 are used to sound
an alarm upon waterflow switch activation.

Section 12.3.6 is hereby added as follows:
12.3.6 Stock of Spare Sprinklers.
Section 12.3.6.1 is hereby added as follows:

12.3.6.1 A supply of at least two sprinklers for
each type shall be maintained on the premises

94 -#



so that any sprinklers that have operated or
been damaged in any way can be promptly
replaced.

Section 12.3.6.2 is hereby added as follows:

12.3.6.2 The sprinklers shall correspond to the
types and temperature ratings of the sprinklers
in the property.

Section 12.3.6.3 is hereby added as follows:

12.3.6.3 The sprinklers shall be kept in a
cabinet located where the temperature to
which they are subjected will at no time exceed
100 °F (38°C).

Section 12.3.6.4 is hereby added as follows:

12.3.6.4 A special sprinkler wrench shall be
provided and kept in the cabinet to be used in
the removal and installation of sprinklers. One
sprinkler wrench shall be provided for each
type of sprinkler installed.

NFPA 14, 2013 Edition, Installation of Standpipe
and Hose Systems is hereby amended as follows:

1.

Section 7.3.1.1 is hereby is deleted in its
entirety and replaced as follows:

7.311 Class | and Il Standpipe hose
connections shall be unobstructed and shall be
located not less than 18 inches or more than
24 inches above the finished floor. Class Il
Standpipe hose connections shall be
unobstructed and shall be located not less than
3 feet or more than 5 feet above the finished
floor.

NFPA 24, 2013 Edition, Installation of Private Fire
Service Mains and Their Appurtenances is hereby
amended as follows:

1.

Section 6.2.1.1 is hereby added as follows:

31



6.2.1.1 The closest upstream indicating valve
to the riser shall be painted OSHA red.

Section 6.2.11 (5) is hereby deleted without
replacement and (6) and (7) renumbered as
follows:

(5) Control Valves installed in a fire-rated room
accessible from the exterior.

(6) Control valves in a fire-rated stair enclosure
accessible from the exterior as permitted
by the authority having jurisdiction.

Section 6.3.3 is hereby added as follows:

Section 6.3.3 All post indicator valves
controlling fire suppression water supplies shall
be painted OSHA red.

Section 10.1.6.3 is hereby added as follows:

10.1.6.3 All ferrous pipe shall be coated and
wrapped. Joints shall be coated and wrapped
after assembly. All fittings shall be protected
with a loose 8-mil polyethylene tube. The ends
of the tube shall extend past the joint by a
minimum of 12 inches and be sealed with 2
inch wide tape approved for underground use.
Galvanizing does not meet the requirements of
this section. :

Exception: 304 or 316 Stainless Steel pipe and
fittings

Section 10.3.6.2 is hereby revised to read in its
entirety as follows:

10.3.6.2 All bolted joint accessories shall be
cleaned and thoroughly coated with asphalt or
other corrosion-retarding material, prior to poly-
tube, and after installation.

Exception: Bolted joint accessories made from
304 or 316 stainless steel.

32



6. Section 10.3.6.3 is hereby added as follows:

10.3.6.3 All bolts used in pipe-joint assembly
shall be 316 stainless steel.

7. Section 10.6.3.1 is hereby revised to read in its
entirety as follows:

10.6.3.1 Where fire service mains enter the
building adjacent to the foundation, the pipe
may run under a building to a maximum of 24
inches, as measured from the interior face of
the exterior wall to the center of the vertical
pipe. The pipe under the building or building
foundation shall be 304 or 316 stainless steel
and shall not contain mechanical joints or it
shall comply with 10.6.2.

8. Section 10.6.4 is hereby revised to read in its
entirety as follows:

10.6.4 Pipe joints shall not be located under
foundation footings. The pipe under the
building or building foundation shall be 304 or
316 stainless steel and shall not contain
mechanical joints.

15.08.100 Construction of Off-Street Parking Lots.

A.

Paving. All off-street parking lots shall be paved
according to the City specifications, with an all-
weather surface of asphalt or concrete paving.
Preparation of Specifications. The City Engineer shall
prepare such specifications for use by the owner or
builder of such off-street parking space.

Construction Permit Required. No off-street parking
lot may be constructed without there being issued a
permit therefor by the Building and Safety
Superintendent of the City.

Application for Construction Permit. Application for
such permit shall be accompanied by a plot plan
showing the size of the proposed parking lot, method
of ingress and egress, layout of stalls, bumper guard
locations and such other pertinent facts as may be
required by the Building and Safety Superintendent to

33



Section 2.

determine whether such application meets the
requirements and regulations of the City.

amended to read in its entirety as follows:

Chapter 15.12 ELECTRICAL CODE

15.12.010 Electrical Code Adopted — Where filed.
15.12.020 Amendments, additions and deletions

15.12.010 Electrical Code Adopted — Where filed.

The City Council of the City of San Clemente hereby adopts
by reference California Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 3,
known and designated as the California Electrical Code,
2013 Edition based on the National Electrical Code (NEC),
2011 Edition, as published by the National Fire Protection
Association with the modifications set forth below for the
purpose of prescribing regulations for the installation,
arrangement, alteration, repairing, replacement, remodeling,
or use and other operation of electrical wiring, connections,
fixtures and other electrical appliances on premises within
the City. The provisions of this code shall constitute the
electrical code regulations of the City. The California
Electrical Code is on file for public examination in the City’s
Building Division office.

15.12.020 Amendments, additions and deletions.

A. A new Section 90.0 of Article 90 of the California
Electrical Code is hereby added to read in its entirety
as follows:

90.0 Administration and Fees.

Administrative provisions contained in Division |l of
Chapter 1 of the California Building Code and
California Residential Code, as amended by the City
of San Clemente, shall apply to the California
Electrical Code, as adopted and amended by the City
of San Clemente.

34

Chapter 15.12 of the San Clemente Municipal Code is hereby



A new Subdivision (L) is hereby added to Section
300.5 of Article 300 of Chapter 3 of the California
Electrical Code to read in its entirety as follows:

(L) Underground utilities required. Overhead
wiring shall not be installed outside on private
property. The building official, as a condition
precedent to the issuance of a building permit, shall
require all utility services located within any lot to be
installed underground if:

(a) The property is to be developed with a new or

relocated main building

For purposes of this section, “main building” shall
mean a building in which is conducted the principal
use of the lot or building site on which such building is
located.

The owner or developer of the property shall be
responsible for complying with the requirements of
this section and shall provide all the necessary
facilities on the property to receive such services from
the supplying utilities. If the building official
determines that application of this requirement causes
extraordinary hardship, the building official may
modify or delay the imposition of the undergrounding
requirement upon approval of property owner’s
application therefore. If the building official
determines to delay the installation of the
requirement, he may require a recorded agreement
guaranteeing the future performance of the work,
together with adequate performance security in the
form of a cash, surety bond, or letter of credit.

For purposes of this section, appurtenances and
associated equipment, such as, but not limited to,
surface-mounted transformers, pedestal-mounted
terminal boxes and meter cabinets, and concealed
ducts in an underground system may be placed
above ground.

Subdivision (B) of Section 310.106 of Article 310 of
Chapter 3 of the California Electrical Code is hereby
amended to read in its entirety as follows:

35

-7



(B) Conductor Material. Conductors in this article

shall be of aluminum, copper-clad aluminum, or -

copper unless otherwise specified.

Copper wire shall be the material used when plans or
installations require No. 6 or smaller wiring.

Aluminum wire may only be permitted on an individual
case-by-case basis by the Building Official. Any such
approval shall be based upon findings showing that all
of the following conditions exist:

(a) Wire size shall not be less than No. 6

(b) Continuous inspection of each connection by a
qualified inspector approved by the Building
Official in advance.

(c) Installation of antioxide compound/material at
each connection.

(d) Use of electrical equipment listed for aluminum
wiring.

(e) The installer shall notify the building owner in
writing that aluminum wiring was used. The
notification shall specify exact locations of wire
and its purposes. Certificate of Occupancy will not
be issued until a copy of the notification letter is
submitted to the Building Official for a review and
approval.

Solid aluminum conductors 8, 10, and 12 AWG shall
be made of an AA-8000 series electrical grade
aluminum alloy conductor material. Stranded
aluminum conductors 8 AWG through 1000 kcmil
marked as Type RHH, RHW, XHHW, THW, THHW,
THWN, THHN, service-entrance Type SE Style U and
SE Style R shall be made of an AA-8000 series
electrical grade aluminum alloy conductor material

Table No. 310.106(A) of Section 310.106 of Article
310 of Chapter 3 of the California Electrical Code is
hereby amended by adding a note at the bottom to
read as follows:

**Note. Use of aluminum conductors requires prior

approval from Building Official. See Section
310.106(B), Conductor Material.

36



Section 3.

Chapter 15.16 MECHANICAL CODE

15.16.010 Mechanical Code Adopted — Where filed.
15.16.020 Amendments, additions and deletions

15.16.010 Mechanical Code Adopted — Where filed.

The City Council of the City of San Clemente hereby adopts
by reference California Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 4,
known and designated as the California Mechanical Code,
2013 Edition based on the 2012 Uniform Mechanical Code
as published by the International Association of Plumbing
and Mechanical Officials with the modifications set forth
below for the purpose of prescribing regulations for the
design, construction, installation, quality of materials,
location, operation and maintenance or use of heating,
ventilating, cooling, refrigeration systems, incinerators and
other heat-producing appliances in the City including
Appendices B, C, D and F. The provisions of this code shall
constitute the mechanical code regulations of the City. The
California Mechanical Code is on file for public examination
in the City’s Building Division office.

15.16.020 Amendments, additions and deletions.

A. Sections 113.4 and 114.0 of Division Il of Chapter 1 of
the California Mechanical Code are hereby deleted
and replaced by the following:

114.0 Administration and Fees. Administrative and
fee provisions contained in Division Il of Chapter 1 of
the California Building Code and California
Residential Code, as amended by the City of San
Clemente, shall apply to the California Mechanical
Code, as adopted and amended by the City of San
Clemente.

B. The first paragraph of Subsection 504.2 of the Section
504 of the California Mechanical Code is hereby
amended to read as follows:

504.2 Domestic Range Hoods and Vents. Kitchen
range hoods shall be installed for cooking facilities

37

Chapter 15.16 of the San Clemente Municipal Code is hereby
amended to read in its entirety as follows:

H 14



with an approved forced-draft system of ventilation
vented to the outside of the building. Ducts used for
domestic kitchen range ventilation shall be of metal,
or other approved material, and shall have smooth
interior surfaces. Ducts for domestic range hoods
shall only serve cooking appliances. (Balance of the
subsection to remain unchanged.)

C. Subsection 1308.5 of Section 1308 of California
Mechanical Code is hereby amended by adding the
following sentences to the end of the paragraph:

Approved PE pipe and fittings shall be used in
exterior buried gas piping systems. Ferrous gas
piping is not permitted to be installed underground
unless a soils analysis is provided to show that soil
conditions will not be damaging to the piping material.

Section 4. Chapter 15.20 of the San Clemente Municipal Code is hereby
amended to read in its entirety as follows:

Chapter 15.20 PLUMBING CODE

15.20.010 Plumbing Code Adopted — Where filed.
15.20.020 Amendments, additions and deletions

15.20.010 Plumbing Code Adopted — Where filed.

The City Council of the City of San Clemente hereby adopts
by reference California Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 5,
known and designated as the California Plumbing Code,
2013 Edition based on the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code as
published by the International Association of Plumbing and
Mechanical Officials with the modifications set forth below for
the purpose of prescribing regulations for the design, quality
of materials, erection, installation, alteration, repair,
relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of
plumbing systems in the City including Appendices A, B, C,
D, H, and |. The provisions of this code shall constitute the
plumbing code regulations of the City. The California
Plumbing Code is on file for public examination in the City's
Building Division office.

38 5/7,4";0



15.20.020 Amendments, additions and deletion.

A

Sections 103.3 and 103.4 of Division Il of Chapter 1 of
the California Plumbing Code are hereby deleted and
replaced by the following:

103.3 Administration and Fees. Administrative
provisions contained in Division Il of Chapter 1 of the
California Building Code and California Residential
Code, as amended by the City of San Clemente, shall
apply to the California Plumbing Code, adopted and
amended by the City of San Clemente.

Subsection 604.1 of Section 604.0 of the California
Plumbing Code is hereby amended by adding a
sentence to end of the third paragraph to read as
follows:

Ferrous materials are prohibited for water pipe and
fittings when installed in the ground unless a soils
analysis is provided to show that soil conditions will
not be damaging to the piping material. (Balance of
the section to remain unchanged)

Subsection 604.2 of Section 604.0 of the California
Plumbing Code is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

604.2 Copper tube for water piping shall have a
weight of not less than Type K.

Exception. Type L copper tubing may be used for
water piping when piping is underground and not
within the footprint of the building foundation and
Type M copper tubing may be used for water
piping when piping is aboveground in, or on, a
building.

ltem no. (2) in Subsection 609.3 of Section 609.0 of
the California Plumbing Code is hereby amended to
read in its entirety as follows:

(2) Copper water piping installed under concrete floor
slabs within a building or structure shall be
copper tube Type “K” and shall be installed
without joints where possible. Where joints are

39

495/



permitted, they shall be brazed and fitting shall
be wrought copper. Such copper tubing shall be
placed in a sand bed a minimum of three inches
(3") in depth, and properly protected penetrates
concrete and similar materials.

(Balance of the section to remain unchanged)

E. Subsection 610.8 of Section 610.0 of the California
Plumbing Code is hereby amended by deleting the
last paragraph and replacing it with the following:

No building supply pipe shall be less than one inch
(1”) in diameter unless a design or calculations are
submitted and approved by Administrative Authority.
Each main building shall have a minimum of two
three-quarter-inch (3/4”) hose bibs; one located
readily accessible to the front yard and one to the
back yard.

Fx A new item no. (7) is hereby added to Section 701.1
of the California Plumbing Code to read as follows:

(7) Cast iron shall not be used for drainage and waste
piping when installed in the ground unless a soils
analysis is provided to show that soil conditions
will not be damaging to the piping material.

G. Subsection 1208.5 of Section 1208 of California
Plumbing Code is hereby amended by adding the
following sentences to the end of the paragraph:

Approved PE pipe and fittings shall be used in
exterior buried gas piping systems. Ferrous gas
piping is not permitted to be installed underground
unless a soils analysis is provided to show that soil
conditions will not be damaging to the piping material.

Section 5. Chapter 15.21 of the San Clemente Municipal Code is hereby
amended to read in its entirety as follows:
Chapter 15.21 GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE
15.21.010 Green Building Standards Code Adopted —

Where filed.
15.21.020 Amendments, additions and deletions

40 %/”- 44,



15.21.010 Green Building Standards Code Adopted —
Where filed.

For the purpose of prescribing regulations for the planning,
design, operation, construction, use and occupancy of newly
constructed buildings and structures in the City to reduce the
negative environmental impacts, subject to the modifications
set forth in this Chapter, the City Council of the City of San
Clemente hereby adopts by reference California Code of
Regulations Title 24, Part 11, known and designated as the
California Green Building Standards Code, 2013 Edition
(CGBSC)), as published by the International Code Council.
A copy of the California Green Building Standards Code is
on file for public examination in the City’s Building Division
office.

15.21.020 Amendments, additions and deletions.

A. Section 202 of the CGBSC is hereby amended by
adding the following definition:

SUSTAINABILITY. Consideration of present
development and construction impacts on the
community, the economy, and the environment without
compromising the needs of the future.

B. Subsection 4.304.1 of Section 4.304 of the CGBSC is
amended to read in its entirety as follows:

4.304.1 Irrigation controllers. Automatic irrigation
system controllers for landscaping provided and
installed at the time of final inspection and shall comply
with the following:

1. Controllers shall be weather- or soil moisture-
based irrigation controllers that automatically
adjust irrigation in response to changes in plants’
needs as weather conditions change.

2. Weather-based controllers without integral rain
sensors or communication systems that account
for local rainfall shall have a separate wired or
wireless rain  sensor which connects of
communicates with the controller(s). Soil
moisture-based controllers are not required to
have rain sensor input.

41

7454



Section 6. Chapter 15.22 of the San Clemente Municipal Code is hereby
amended to read in its entirety as follows:

Chapter 15.22 RESIDENTIAL CODE

15.22.010 Residential Code Adopted — Where filed.

15.22.020 Division Il of Chapter 1 amended —
Administration.

15.22.025 Chapter 2 amended — Definitions.

15.22.030 Chapter 3 amended — Building Planning.

15.22.040 Chapter 4 amended — Foundations.

15.22.050 Chapter 6 amended — Wall Construction.

15.22.060 Chapter 9 amended — Roof Assemblies.

15.22.070 Chapter 44 amended — Referenced Standards
(NFPA 13, NFPA 13R, NFPA 13D).

15.22.010 Residential Code Adopted — Where filed.

For the purpose of prescribing regulations for erection,
construction, enlargement, alteration, replacement, repairr,
improvement, removal, movement, conversion, demolition,
use and occupancy, equipment, height, location,
maintenance, and areas of detached one—and two-family
residential dwellings, townhomes and structures accessory
thereto in the City, subject to the modifications set forth in
this Chapter, the City Council of the City of San Clemente
hereby adopts by reference California Code of Regulations
Title 24, Part 2.5, known and designated as the California
Residential Code (CRC), 2013 Edition, based on the 2012
International Residential Code as published by the
International Code Council including Appendix H. A copy of
this code is on file for public examination in the City’s
Building Division office.

15.22.020 Division Il of Chapter 1 amended — Administration.
Division | of Chapter 1 of CRC is hereby amended as follows:

A. Subsection R101.1 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

R101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as

the California Residential Code, and may be cited as
such and will be referred to herein as “this code”.

o 454



Subsection R101.2 is hereby amended by adding a
second paragraph to read as follows:

The provisions of this code shall apply to and affect all
of the territory of the City of San Clemente, except
work located primarily in a public way, public utility
towers and poles, mechanical equipment not
specifically regulated in these codes, hydraulic flood
control structures, facilities for the production,
generation, storage or transmission of water or
electrical energy by a local agency, and except as
exempted by these codes.

Subsection R105.2 is hereby amended by deleting
items 1 through 10 under the heading “Building” and
replacing them with the following:

Building:

1. One-story detached accessory buildings used as
tool and storage sheds, playhouses and similar
uses and structures such as portable shade cloth
structures, provided the floor area does not
exceed 120 square feet (11 m?®. Such structures
must comply with the setback and height
requirements of the City Zoning Ordinance and the
Fire Code.

2. Fences not over 6 feet high.

3. Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet in height
measured from the bottom of footing to the top of
wall unless supporting a surcharge or impounding
Class I, Il or llIA liquids.

4. Water tanks supported directly on grade if the
capacity does not exceed 5,000 gallons and the
ratio of height to diameter or width does not
exceed 2:1.

5. Sidewalks and driveways.
6. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets,

counter tops and similar finish work that does not
involve electrical, mechanical or plumbing work.

43

W45



7. Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a
Group R-3 occupancy that are less than 18 inches
deep, do not exceed 5,000 gallons and are
installed entirely above ground.

8. Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or
agricultural purposes, not including service
systems.

9. Swings and other playground equipment
accessory to detached one- and two-family
dwellings.

10. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall
that do not project more than 54 inches from the
exterior wall and do not require additional support
of Group R-3 and U occupancies.

11.Detached decks, platforms or similar structures
not exceeding 200 square feet in area, walkways
that are not more than 30 inches (762mm) above
adjacent grade, and not over any basement or
story below and do not serve the exit door
required by Section R311.4.

12.Non-fixed and movable fixtures, cases, racks,
counters and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches in
height.

13.Radio and television antenna, and flagpoles not
over twelve (12) feet in height measured from
grade.

Unless otherwise exempted, separate plumbing,
electrical and mechanical permits will be required for
the above-exempted items.

Subsection R105.3.2 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows: :

R105.3.2 Time limitation of application. An
application for a permit for any proposed work shall
be deemed to have been abandoned 360 days after
the date of filing, unless such application has been
pursued in good faith or permit has been issued;
except that the building official is authorized to grant

44



one or more extensions of time for additional periods
not exceeding 90 days each. The extension shall be
requested in writing and justifiable cause
demonstrated. The total period of application
extensions granted shall not exceed an additional 18
months. In order to renew action on an application
after expiration, the applicant shall resubmit plans and
pay a new plan check fee.

Subsection R105.5 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

R105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued shall
become invalid unless the work on the site authorized
by such permit is commenced within 180 days after its
issuance, or if the work authorized on the site by such
permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180
days after the time the work commenced.

Any permittee holding an unexpired permit may apply
for an extension of the time within which work may
commence under that permit when the permittee is
unable to commence work within the time required.
The extension shall be requested in writing prior to
the permit expiring and show justifiable cause
demonstrating that circumstances beyond the control
of the permittee have prevented action from being
taken. Pursuant to this paragraph, the Building
Official or his/her designee is authorized to grant, in
writing, one extension of time, for a period not more
than 180 days. The completion of construction shall
not extend beyond the timeframes mandated in
Section R105.10 of this code even with such
extension.

Before such work can be recommenced after a permit
expires, a new permit shall first be obtained, and a fee
therefore shall be one half the amount required for a
new permit for such work, provided no changes have
been made or will be made in the original plans and
specifications for such work, and provided further that
such suspension or abandonment has not exceeded
one year. In order to renew action on a permit after
this one year time period, the permittee shall pay a
new full permit fee.

45

G8-57



A new Subsection R105.10 is hereby added to
Section R105 to read in its entirety as follows.

R105.10 Completion of construction.

Notwithstanding subsection R105.5 above, all

construction shall be completed by the owner, owner's

agent, or the permittee and approved by the City

within the following time frame:

a. New residential buildings construction . . . 24
months

b. Residential room additions and remodels . . . 12

months

Pools/spas . . . 12 months

Patio covers and similar structures . . . 6 months

Fences and/or retaining walls . . . 6 months

Water heaters, water softeners and air

conditioners . . . 6 months ’

g. All other minor alterations . . . 6 months

"0 oo

Upon written request of the owner or permittee, the
Building  Official and/or  his/her  designated
representative may extend the period for completion
of construction for a period not to exceed one
hundred eighty (180) days. The written request must
demonstrate that (1) due to circumstances beyond the
owner's or permittee's control, construction could not
be completed in the required construction period; (2)
that reasonable progress has been made; (3) that the
condition of the property presents no health or safety
hazard; and (4) that the continued delay will not
create any unreasonable visual or physical detriment
to the neighborhood. Any extension beyond one
hundred eighty (180) days must be approved by the
City Manager.

The requirement of this subsection shall apply to all
construction projects undertaken prior to the effective
date of this subsection except that the construction
period set forth shall run from the effective date of
this subsection rather than from the date construction
was commenced or a building permit was issued for
the project.

46



A new Subsection R105.11 is hereby added to
Section R105 to read in its entirety as follows.

R105.11 Maintenance of property during
construction. During construction, all property shall
be maintained in a reasonably clean and well-kept
manner. All lumber and building materials shall be
neatly piled or stacked in a safe manner and stored in
the rear yard of the residential property or inside the
building construction perimeter, except that building
materials may be stored in a front yard for a period
not to exceed thirty (30) days. A waiver of this
requirement may be obtained from the Building
Official or his/her designated representative if the
construction is screened from view from adjacent
occupied or public property with fencing materials
approved by city zoning and building regulations.

A new Subsection R106.1.4 is hereby added to
Section R106 to read in its entirety as follows:

R106.1.4 Soil report. A Soil report shall be
submitted with all permit applications for new
construction and additions. Soil Reports shall be
prepared by a professional engineer licensed by the
State to prepare such reports. The Building Official
may waive this requirement if he/she finds that the
scope of work applied for does not necessitate a soll
report.

Subsection R106.3 is hereby amended to add a
second paragraph that reads as follows:

When submittal documents are required by Section
R106.1, a plan review fee shall be paid at the time of
submitting the submittal documents for plan review.
Said plan review fees are separate fees from the
permit fees specified in Section R108 and are in
addition to the permit fees. Said plan review fee shall
be as set forth in the City Council Fee Resolution.

Subsection R106.5 is hereby amended to add a
second paragraph that reads as follows:

The approved plans, permit application, inspection
card and other construction documents required by

47

7959



the Building Official shall be imaged after the final
inspection and will be a permanent record in the City.
The applicant shall pay the cost of imaging at the time
of permit.

Subsection R108.2 is hereby amended by adding a
sentence at the end to read as follows:

The fee for each permit shall be as set forth in the
City Council Fee Resolution unless otherwise
specified by the code.

Subsection R108.3 is hereby amended to add a
second paragraph that reads as follows:

The Building Official shall make the determination of
value or valuation under any provisions of this code.
The valuation shall be determined by using rational
methods established by the Building Official that
reasonably establish the construction value or the
contract price of the actual construction cost. The
value of work to be used in computing the Building
Permit and Building Plan Review fees shall be the
total value of all construction work for which the
permit is issued, as well as all finish work, painting,
roofing, electrical, plumbing, heating, air conditioning,
elevators, fire extinguishing systems and any other
permanent equipment.

Subsection R108.5 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

R108.5 Refunds. The building official is authorized to
establish a refund policy. The building official may
authorize refunding of any fee paid hereunder which
was erroneously paid or collected as provided below.

The building official may authorize refunding of not
more than 80 percent of the permit fee paid when no
work has been done under a permit issued in
accordance with this code.

The building official may authorize refunding of not

more than 80 percent of the plan review fee paid
when an application for a permit for which a plan

48

Y60



review has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before
any plan reviewing is done.

The building official shall not authorize refunding of
any fee paid except on written application filed by the
original permittee not later than 180 days after the
date of payment.

Subsection R108.6 is hereby amended to add a
second paragraph that reads as follows:

An investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, shall
be collected whether or not a permit is then or
subsequently issued. The investigation fee shall be
equal to the amount of the permit fee required by this
code. The payment of such investigation fee shall not
exempt any person from compliance with all other
provisions of this code nor from any penalty
prescribed by law.

A new Subsection R108.7 is hereby added to Section
R108 to read in its entirety as follows:

R108.7 Deposit. The Building Official may require a
deposit from the applicant for a certain project or work
in order to secure the request of final inspection
approvals from the applicant or the repairing of
damaged City properties during the period of
construction. The deposit money will be refunded to
the applicant when the final inspections are approved
or the damages are repaired to the satisfaction of the
City. The deposit amount shall not be more than
twice the permit fee.

A new Subsection R109.5 is hereby added to Section
R109 to read in its entirety as follows:

R109.5 Reinspections. A reinspection fee may be
assessed for each inspection or reinspection when
such portion of work for which an inspection is
requested is not complete or when previous
corrections are not corrected.

This subsection is not to be interpreted as requiring

reinspection fees the first time a job is rejected for
failure to comply with requirements of this Code, but

49



as controlling the practice of calling for inspections
before the job is ready for such inspection or
reinspection.

Reinspection fees may be assessed when the
inspection record card is not posted or otherwise
made available on the work site, or when the
approved plans are not readily available to the
inspector, or for failure to provide access on the date
for which inspection is requested.

To obtain a reinspection, the applicant shall pay the
reinspection fee as established by the City Council
Fee Resolution. In instances where reinspection
fees have been assessed, no additional inspection of
work will be performed until the required reinspection
fees have been paid.

15.22.025 Chapter 2 amended — Definitions.

Chapter 2 of CRC is hereby amended as follows:

A

Subsection R202 is hereby amended by adding the
following definition:

HAZARDOUS FIRE AREA. Includes all areas
identified within California Fire Code Section 4906.2
and other areas as determined by the Fire Code
Official as presenting a fire hazard due to the
presence of combustible vegetation, or the proximity
of the property to an area that contains combustible
vegetation.

15.22.030 Chapter 3 amended — Building Planning.

Chapter 3 of CRC is hereby amended as follows:

A.

Table R301.2(1) in Section R301 is hereby amended
to read in its entirety as follows:

50

e



TABLE R301.2(1)
CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA

WIND DESIGN SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM
GROUND | Speed SEISMIC Frost WINTER ICE BARRIER AR MEAN
SNOwW ¢ |Topographic| DESIGN line DESIGN | UNDERLAYMENT | FLOOD |FREEZING | ANNUAL
LOAD |(mph)| effects [CATEGORY 'Weathering® Depth® [Termite | TEMP*® REQUIRED HAZARDS °| INDEX' TEMP'
Footnote
Very g
Zero 85 No DiorD; Negligible 12” Heavy 43 No Below 0 60

For SI: 1 pound per square foot = 0.0479 kPa, 1 mile per hour = 0.447 m/s.

a. Weathering may require a higher strength concrete or grade of masonry than necessary to satisfy the structural
requirements of this code. The weathering column shall be filled in with the weathering index (i.e., "negligible,"
"moderate" or "severe") for concrete as determined from the Weathering Probability Map [Figure R301.2(3)]. The
grade of masonry units shall be determined from ASTM C 34, C 55, C 62, C 73, C 90, C129,C145,C2160rC
652.

b. The frost line depth may require deeper footings than indicated in Figure R403.1(1). The jurisdiction shall fill in
the frost line depth column with the minimum depth of footing below finish grade.

¢. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table to indicate the need for protection depending on whether there
has been a history of local subterranean termite damage.

d.” The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the wind speed from the basic wind speed map [Figure
R301.2( 4)].Wind exposure category shall be determined on a site-specific basis in accordance with Section
R301.2.1.4.

e. Temperatures shall be permitted to reflect local climates or local weather experience as determined by the
building official.

f.  The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the seismic design category determined from Section
R301.2.2.1.

g. Flood Hazard Maps
FEMA - National Flood Insurance Program (NFIP)

Gommunity Gommemnity FIRM-Panel Initial NFIP Map | Initial FIRM Date | MostRecent
Name Number Number Date FIRM Panel

San Clemente 060230 06059C0507J 06/14/1974 12/04 /1979 12/03 /2009
06059C0508J
06059C0509J
06059C0517J
06059C0526J
06059C0528J
06059C0536J
06059C0538.

FEMA — Federal Emergency Management Agency
NFIP — National Flood Insurance Program
FIRM — Flood Insurance Rate Map
Also see — San Clemente Municipal Code Chapter 15.76 — Flood Damage Prevention

i.  The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the 100-year return period air freezing index (BF-days) from
Figure R403.3(2) or from the 100-year (99%) value on the National Climatic Data Center data table "Air Freezing
Index- USA Method (Base 32°)" at www.ncdc.noaa.gov/fpsf.htrnl.

j.  The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the mean annual temperature from the National Climatic Data
Center data table "Air Freezing Index-USA Method (Base 32°F)" at www.ncdc.noaa.gov/fpsf.html.

51 9142



A new Subsection R301.9 is hereby added to Section
R301 to read in its entirety as follows:

R301.9 Development On Or Near Land Containing
Or Emitting Toxic, Combustible or Flammable
Liquids, Gases or Vapors. The fire code official
may require the submittal for approval of geological
studies, evaluations, reports, remedial
recommendations and/or similar documentation from
a state-licensed and department-approved individual
or firm, on any parcel of land to be developed which
has, or is adjacent to, or within 1,000 feet (304.8 m) of
a parcel of land that has an active, inactive, or
abandoned oil or gas well operation, petroleum or
chemical refining facility, petroleum or chemical
storage, or may contain or give off toxic, combustible
or flammable liquids, gases or vapors.

A new Subsection R301.10 is hereby added to
Section R301 to read in its entirety as follows:

R301.10 Fuel Modification Requirements for New
Construction. All new buildings to be built or
installed in areas with or adjacent to land having
hazardous combustible vegetation shall comply with
the requirements in the edition of OCFA Vegetation
Management Guidelines currently in use at the time.

Table R302.1(2) in Section R302 is hereby amended
by deleting footnote “a” (balance of the Table fto
remain unchanged).

Subsection R313.1 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinklers
systems. An automatic residential fire sprinkler
system installed in Townhouses as follows:

New buildings: An automatic sprinkler system shall
be installed throughout all new townhouse buildings,
including the attached garages.

Existing buildings: An automatic sprinkler system
shall be installed throughout existing buildings,

52



including the attached garages, when one of the
following conditions exists:

1.

All existing Group R occupancies and U-1 garages
when the total floor area is increase by 50% of the
existing area over a 2-year period

All existing Group R occupancies and U-1 garages
when the total area is increased by 750 square
feet or more over a 2-year period

All existing Group R occupancies and U-1 garages
when an additional story is added to the structure
regardless of the area involved

An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed
throughout any existing Group R Occupancy
building when the floor area of the Alteration or
Combination of an Addition and Alteration, within
any two year period, is 50% or more of area of the
existing structure and where the scope of the work
exposes building framing and facilitates sprinkler
installation and is such that the Building/Fire Code
Official determines that the complexity of installing
a sprinkler system would be similar as in a new
building.

Any addition to existing building that has fire
sprinklers installed.

Exceptions: ,

1. Existing Group R-3 occupancies converted to
Group R-3.1 occupancies not housing
bedridden clients, not housing nonambulatory
clients above the first floor and not housing
clients above the second floor.

2. Existing Group R-3 occupancies converted to
Group R-3.1 occupancies housing only one
bedridden client and complying with CBC
Section 425.8.3.3.

3. Pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section
13113 occupancies housing ambulatory
children only, none of whom are mentally ill
or mentally retarded, and the buildings or
portions thereof in which such children are
housed are not more than two stories in
height, and buildings or portions thereof
housing such children have an automatic fire
alarm system activated by approved smoke
detectors.

53

W65



4. Pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section
13143.6 occupancies licensed for protective
social care which house ambulatory clients
only, none of whom is a child (under the age
of 18 years), or who is elderly (65 years of
age or over).

Subsection R313.2 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

R313.2 One- and two-family dwellings automatic
fire sprinklers systems. An automatic residential
fire sprinkler system installed in one- and two-family
dwellings as follows:

New buildings: An automatic sprinkler system shall
be installed throughout all new one- and two-family
dwellings, including the attached garages.

Existing buildings: An automatic sprinkler system
shall be installed throughout existing buildings,
including the attached garages, when one of the
following conditions exists:

-

. All existing Group R occupancies and U-1 garages
when the total floor area is increase by 50% of the
existing area over a 2-year period

2. All existing Group R occupancies and U-1 garages

when the total area is increased by 750 square
feet or more over a 2-year period

3. All existing Group R occupancies and U-1 garages

when an additional story is added to the structure
regardless of the area involved

4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed

throughout any existing Group R Occupancy
building when the floor area of the Alteration or
Combination of an Addition and Alteration, within
any two year period, is 50% or more of area of the
existing structure and where the scope of the work
exposes building framing and facilitates sprinkler
installation and is such that the Building/Fire Code
Official determines that the complexity of installing
a sprinkler system would be similar as in a new
building.

5. Any addition to existing "building that has fire

sprinklers installed.

54

Gh-se



Exceptions:

1. Existing Group R-3 occupancies converted to
Group R-3.1 occupancies not housing
bedridden clients, not housing nonambulatory
clients above the first floor and not housing
clients above the second floor.

2. Existing Group R-3 occupancies converted to
Group R-3.1 occupancies housing only one
bedridden client and complying with CBC
Section 425.8.3.3.

3. Pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section
13113 occupancies housing ambulatory
children only, none of whom are mentally ill
or mentally retarded, and the buildings or
portions thereof in which such children are
housed are not more than two stories in
height, and buildings or portions thereof
housing such children have an automatic fire
alarm system activated by approved smoke
detectors.

4. Pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section
13143.6 occupancies licensed for protective
social care which house ambulatory clients
only, none of whom is a child (under the age
of 18 years), or who is elderly (65 years of
age or over).

The first paragraph of subsection R313.3.6.2.2 is
hereby deleted and replaced to read as follows:

R313.3.6.2.2 Calculation procedure. Determination
of the required size for water distribution piping shall
be in accordance with the following procedure and
California Fire Code Section 903.3.5.3.

Subsection R319.1 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

R319.1 Site Address. New and existing buildings
shall have approved address numbers, building
numbers or approved building identification placed in
a position that is plainly legible and visible from the
street or road fronting the property. These numbers
shall contrast with their background. Where required
by the fire code official, address numbers shall be

55

T



provided in additional approved locations to facilitate
emergency response. Address numbers shall be
Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers shall
be a minimum of 4 inches (101.6 mm) high with a
minimum stroke width of 0.5 inch (12.7 mm). Where
access is by means of a private road and the building
cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument,
pole or other sign or means shall be used to identify
the structure. Address numbers shall be maintained.

Subsection R322.1 is hereby amended to read as
follows:

R322.1 General. Buildings and structures constructed
in whole or in part in flood hazard areas (including A
or V Zones) as established in Table R301.2(1) shall
be designed and constructed in accordance with the
provisions contained in this section and in accordance
with Chapter 15.76 of the San Clemente Municipal
Code.

Buildings and structures located in whole or in part in
identified floodways shall be designed and
constructed in accordance with ASCE 24 and in
accordance with Chapter 15.76 of the San Clemente
Municipal Code.

A new Subsection R327.1.6 is hereby added to read
in its entirety as follows:

R327.1.6 Fuel Modification Requirements for New
Construction. All new buildings to be built or
installed in hazardous fire areas shall comply with the
following:

1. Preliminary fuel modification plans shall be
submitted to and approved by the fire code official
concurrent with the submittal for approval of any
tentative map.

2. Final fuel modification plans shall be submitted to
and approved by the fire code official prior to the
issuance of a grading permit.

56

9445



2.1 The fuel modification plan shall include
provisions for the maintenance of the fuel
modification for perpetuity.

. The fuel modification plans shall meet the criteria

set forth in the Fuel Modification Section of the
Orange County Fire Authority Vegetation
Management Guidelines.

. The fuel modification plan may be altered if

conditions change. Any alterations to the fuel
modification areas shall have prior approval from
the fire code official.

All elements of the fuel modification plan shall be
maintained in accordance with the approved plan
and are subject to the enforcement process
outlined in the Fire Code.

15.22.040 Chapter 4 amended — Foundations.

Chapter 4 of CRC is hereby amended as follows:

A.

Subsection R403.1.3 is hereby amended by deleting
the exception (balance of subsection fo remain
unchanged).

Subsection R405.1 is hereby amended by deleting
the exception (balance of subsection to remain
unchanged).

15.22.050 Chapter 6 amended — Wall Construction.

Chapter 6 of CRC is hereby amended as follows:

A.

Table R602.10.3(3) is amended to read as follows:

57

944



TABLE R602.10.3(3)
BRACING REQUIREMENTS BASED ON SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY

) \sﬂgltlf:ll'lJE\}SGsH?h 10 FEET
: 1OPSFFLOORDEADLOAD N CUTAED ALONG EAGH BRAGED WALL LNES |
- BRACED WALL LINE SPACING < 25 FEET
Methods
5“%’::;2‘;‘9" Story Location Elr:: ?.?ar%?“ Method LIB: | Mothod GB £ B‘B'"sﬁ' Psgg. Mﬂ;‘gd "33_'3%‘5?
(feat) HPS, CS-SFA¢:2 C3-G
10 25 75 25 1.6 14
20 5.0 50 5.0 3.2 2.7
30 75 75 75 48 41
40 10.0 10.0 10.0 64 5.4
50 125 12.5 125 8.0 6.8
10 NP 45 45 30 26
20 NP 9.0 9.0 6.0 5.1
( [DwnlquS{:S only) 30 NP 135 135 20 17
40 NP 18.0 18.0 12.0 102
50 NP 225 25 15.0 128
10 NP 6.0 6.0 43 38
20 NP 12,0 12,0 9.0 737
30 NP 18.0 18.0 135 1.5
40 NP 24.0 24.0 18.0 15.3
50 NP 30.0 300 25 19.1
10 NP 2858 23-58| 18 16
A 20 NP Ss5410| -Ssus| 36 3.1
A ﬁ = 30 NP —83-1686 $3-188 54 46
p— 4 NP 440220 M0 72 6.1
50 NP 438-278| 438-2z8] 90 7.7
10 NP e S3-w | 38 32
N\ 20 NP ET.ES) Ho5-me [ 75 64
D, A 30 NP 45600 | 458w | 113 96
= 40 NP 2108 [ 219w | 150 12.8
50 NP 2630 | 2e3-me| 188 16.0
10 NP T3 EENT 53 45
20 NP 5N [ S | 105 9.0
@ 30 NP 248w | 248w | 158 134
40 NP 2pg N | 20480 | 210 17.9
50 NP 363 WP 265 | 263 223
(continted)
58

GH-90



TABLE R602.10.3(3)—continued
BRACING REQUIREMENTS BASED ON SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY

+ SOILCLASS IF
: %APLSLFHFELISSE B‘IE%EELEJAD MINIMUM TOTAL LENGTH (FEET) OF BRACED WALL PANELS
l 15 PSF ROOF/CEILING DEAD LOAD REQUIRED ALONG EACH BRACED WALL LINE*
. BRACED WALL LINE SPACING = 25 FEET
Methods
Seig’:{;g%";'gn Story Location Elr:é:z%;\‘\é?g Method LIB* Method GB = %\%Bé, FC(F‘:;I_B’ X nggd hg%&%%?
SFp.e
10 NP 36 g0 | 3060 20 7
20 NP 60-120| 681200 40 34
30 NP 50-18.0| 461800 60 5.1
40 NP 190240 420240 80 6.8
30 NP 159 30.0) 450300 100 5.3
10 NP %0-NP| 6O-NP| 45 38
20 NP 128-Np|  42e-NP| 90 7.7
D, — @ 30 NP 480 NP | 3%o-Np| 135 1.5
vl 40 NP 249 NP| 246-NP| 180 15.3
50 NP 366 NP| -3eeNp| 225 19.1
10 NP 25 NP| —S-NP| 60 ER]
20 NP 476~ NP| 326-NP| 120 102
30 NP 255 NP| 255-NP| 180 153
40 NP 348~ NP  346-NP| 240 204
50 NP 225 NP| 425 Np| 300 255
10 NP “F-g0| =Sos80] 25 71
20 NP -$6-160| -80-160/ 50 43
30 NP 420-240| 26240 75 6.4
40 NP +66-320| &8320 100 8.3
50 NP 200400| o6400 125 10.6
10 NP F5-NP | F5NP| 55 7
20 NP 456-NP | 456-NP| 110 0.4
0 NP 225 NP | 225NP| 165 14.0
40 NP 366-NP| 366-NP[ 220 187
5 50 NP 375 NP| 375NP| 275 234
2 10 NP NP NP NP NP
AN 20 NP NP NP NP NP
= 30 NP NP NP NP NP
=5 40 NP NP NP NP NP
50 NP NP NP NP NP
10 NP NP NP 73 6.4
20 NP NP NP 15.0 128
Cripple wall below ] 30 NP NP NP 275 191
one- or two-slory dwelling .
40 NP NP NP 30.0 255
50 NP NP NP 375 310

For SI: 1 inch = 254 mm. 1 fool = 305 mm. 1 pound per square [ool = 0.0473 kPa.

a. Lirear inlerpolation shall be permitted.

b. Wall bracing le “D. Interpolation of bracing lenglh betweea the S, valves associaled
shall be pesmitted whea a site-specific S, value is delermined in 2ccordance with Section 1613.2 of the Iniemarional By

¢. Method L1B shall have pypsum bozrd fastened to al feast one side with nails ar screws per Table R602.3¢1) for exterior sheathing or Table R702.3.5 for
inlerir gypsam beard. Spacing of faslencrs at panci edges shall not excced 8 inches

d. Method CS-SFB applics in SDC C oaly.

e, Methads GB =nd PCP braced wall psnel hive ratio shall nat exceed 1:1 in SDC DA, 01 or D2, Methods TAE, SFB, B3, and HPS are not premitted in SDC DI, 01,

ar 02

itk the Seismic Design Categories

g Code.

59 éﬂ' 7



15.22.060 Chapter 9 amended — Roof Assemblies.

Chapter 9 of CRC is hereby amended as follows:

A.

First paragraph of subsection R902.1 is amended to
read in its entirety as follows:

R902.1 Roofing covering materials. Roofs shall be
covered with materials as set forth in Sections R904
and R905. A minimum Class A or B roofing shall be
installed in areas designated by this section. Classes
A and/or B roofing required by this section to be listed
shall be tested in accordance with UL 790 or ASTM E
108. (balance of subsection to remain unchanged).

Subsections R902.1.1, R902.1.2, R902.1.3 are
hereby deleted and replaced with a new Subsection
R902.1.1 to read in its entirety as follows:

R902.1.1 Roof Coverings. The roof covering or
roofing assembly on any new structure regulated by
this code shall be Class A fire retardant roof minimum
as classified in CBC Section 1505.2. Non-
combustible roof covering may be applied in
accordance with the manufacturer's requirements in
lieu of a fire retardant roofing assembly. Wood
roofing materials are prohibited unless pressure
treated and approved for fire retardant of Class A
minimum. For existing structure when ten percent
(10%) or more of the total roof area is re-roofed within
any one-year period, shall have a Class A fire
retardant roof covering for entire roof area. For
existing structure when less than ten percent (10%) of
the total roof area is re-roofed within any one-year
period, shall have a fire retardant roof covering class
equal to or greater than the existing roof covering and
not less than Class B.

The first paragraph of Subsection R902.2 is hereby
amended to read as follows:

R902.2 Fire-retardant-treated shingles and
shakes. Fire-retardant-treated wood shakes and
shingles are wood shakes and shingles complying
with UBC Standard 15-3 or 15-4 which are
impregnated by the full-cell vacuum-pressure process

60

9172



with fire-retardant chemicals, and which have been
qualified by UBC Standard 15-2 for use on Class A or
B roofs. (balance of subsection to remain
unchanged).

D. Subsection R903.4 is hereby amended by adding a
second paragraph to read as follows:

Water that accumulates on a roof shall be effectively
drained and conveyed from the roof to a storm drain,
street gutter, or other locations approved by the
Building Official. Such water shall be conveyed
through gutters, leaders, associated piping or other
non-erodible surface drainage devices as approved
by the Building Official. For any minor or small roofs,
the Building Official may exempt this requirement.

15.22.070 Chapter 44 amended — Referenced
Standards (NFPA 13, NFPA 13R, NFPA 13D).

The Referenced Standards in Chapter 44 of CRC are hereby
amended as follows:

A. NFPA 13, 2013 Edition, Installation of Sprinkler
Systems is hereby amended as follows:

i Section 6.8.3 is hereby revised to read in its
entirety as follows:

6.8.3 Fire department connections (FDC) shall
be of an approved type. The FDC shall contain
a minimum of two 2 %" inlets. The location
shall be approved and be no more than 150
feet from a public hydrant. The FDC may be
located within 150 feet of a private fire hydrant
when approved by the fire code official. The
size of piping and the number of inlets shall be
approved by the fire code official. If acceptable
to the water authority, it may be installed on the
backflow assembly. Fire department inlet
connections shall be painted OSHA safety red.
When the fire sprinkler density design requires
500 gpm (including inside hose stream
demand) or greater, or a standpipe system is
included, four 2 %4” inlets shall be provided.

61

9175



Section 8.3.3.1 is hereby revised to read in its
entirety as follows:

8.3.3.1. When fire sprinkler systems are
installed in shell buildings of undetermined use
(Spec Buildings) other than warehouses (S
occupancies), fire sprinklers of the quick-
response type shall be used. Use is considered
undetermined if a specific tenant/occupant is
not identified at the time the fire sprinkler plan
is submitted. Sprinklers in light hazard
occupancies shall be one of the following:

e) Quick-response type as defined in
3.64.7.

f) Residential sprinklers in accordance with
the requirements of 8.4.5.

9) Standard-response sprinklers used for

modifications or additions to existing light
hazard systems equipped with standard-
response sprinklers.

h) Standard-response  sprinklers  used
where individual standard-response
sprinklers are replaced in existing light
hazard systems.

Section 8.17.1.1.1 is hereby added as follows:

8.17.1.1.1 Residential Waterflow Alarms. A
local water-flow alarm shall be provided on all
sprinkler systems and shall be connected to
the building fire alarm or water-flow monitoring
system, where provided. Group R
occupancies not requiring a fire alarm system
by the California Fire Code shall be provided
with a minimum of one approved interior alarm
device in each unit. Interior alarm devices
shall be required to provide 55 dBA or 15 dBA
above ambient, whichever is greater,
throughout all living spaces within each unit.
Sound levels in all sleeping areas with all
intervening doors closed shall be a minimum of
15 dBA above the average ambient sound
level but not less than 75 dBA, whichever is
greater. When not connected to a fire alarm or
water-flow monitoring system, audible devices

62

Gh-7F



shall be powered from an uninterruptible circuit
(except for over-current protection) serving
normally operated appliances in the residence.

Section 11.1.1.2 is hereby added as follows:

11.1.1.2 When fire sprinkler systems are required in
buildings of undetermined use other than
warehouses, they shall be designed and installed to
have a fire sprinkler density of not less than that
required for an Ordinary Hazard Group 2 use, with
no reduction(s) in density or design area.
Warehouse fire sprinkler systems shall be designed
to Figure 16.2.1.3.2 (d) curve “G’. Use is
considered undetermined if a specific
tenant/occupant is not identified at the time the
sprinkler plan is submitted. Where a subsequent
occupancy requires a system with greater
capability, it shall be the responsibility of the
occupant to upgrade the system to the required
density for the new occupancy.

Section 11.2.3.1.1.1 is hereby added as
follows:

11.2.3.1.1.1 The available water supply for fire
sprinkler system design shall be determined by
one of the following methods, as approved by
the Fire Code Official:

4) Subtract the project site elevation from the
low water level for the appropriate
pressure zone and multiply the result by
0.433;

5) Use a maximum of 40 psi, if available;

6) Utilize the Orange County Fire Authority
water-flow test form/directions to document
a flow test conducted by the local water
agency or an approved third party licensed
in the State of California

Section 23.2.1.1 is hereby revised to read in
its entirety as follows:

23.2.1.1 Where a waterflow test is used for the
purposes of system design, the test shall be
conducted no more than 6 months prior to

63

94-75



working plan submittal unless otherwise
approved by the authority having jurisdiction.

NFPA 13R 2013 Edition Installation of Sprinkler
System in Residential Occupancies up to and
Including Four Stories in Height is hereby amended
as follows:

. Section 6.16.1 is hereby revised to read in its
entirety as follows:

6.16.1 A local water-flow alarms shall be
provided on all sprinkler systems and shall be
connected to the building fire alarm or water-
flow monitoring system where provided. Group
R occupancies containing less than the
number of stories, dwelling units or occupant
load specified in the California Fire Code as
requiring a fire alarm system shall be provided
with a minimum of one approved interior alarm
device in each unit. Interior alarm devices
shall be required to provide 55 dBA or 15 dBA
above ambient, whichever s greater,
throughout all living spaces within each
dwelling unit. Sound levels in all sleeping areas
with all intérvening doors closed shall be a
minimum of 15 dBA above the average
ambient sound level but not less than 75 dBA,
whichever is greater. When not connected to a
fire alarm or water-flow monitoring system,
audible devices shall be powered from an
uninterruptible circuit (except for over-current
protection) serving normally  operated
appliances in the residence.

There shall also be a minimum of one exterior
alarm indicating device, listed for outside
service and audible from the access roadway
that serves that building.

NFPA 13D 2013 Edition Installation of Sprinkler
Systems in One and Two-Family Dwellings and
Manufactured Homes is hereby amended as follows:

Section 7.1.2 is hereby revised to read in its
entirety as follows:

64

g4 7



7.1.2 The system piping shall not have a
separate control valve unless supervised by a
central station, proprietary or remote station
alarm service.

Section 7.6 is hereby deleted in its entirety and
replaced as follows:

7.6 Alarms. Exterior alarm indicating device
shall be listed for outside service and audible
from the street from which the house is
addressed. Exterior audible devices shall be
placed on the front or side of the structure and
the location is subject to final approval by the
fire code official. Additional interior alarm
devices shall be required to provide 55 dBA or
15 dBA above ambient, whichever is greater,
throughout all living spaces. Sound levels in all
sleeping areas with all intervening doors closed
shall be a minimum of 15 dBA above the
average ambient sound level but not less than
75 dBA, whichever is greater. Audible devices
shall be powered from an uninterruptible circuit
(except for over-current protection) serving
normally operated appliances in the residence.

Exceptions:

3. When an approved water flow monitoring
system is installed, interior audible
devices may be powered through the fire
alarm control panel.

4. When smoke detectors specified under
CBC Section 907.2.11 are used to sound
an alarm upon waterflow switch activation.

Section 12.3.6 is hereby added as follows:

12.3.6 Stock of Spare Sprinklers.

Section 12.3.6.1 is hereby added as follows:
12.3.6.1 A supply of at least two sprinklers for
each type shall be maintained on the premises
so that any sprinklers that have operated or
been damaged in any way can be promptly
replaced.

65

gH-77



5. Section 12.3.6.2 is hereby added as follows:

12.3.6.2 The sprinkiers shall correspond to the
types and temperature ratings of the sprinklers
in the property.

6. Section 12.3.6.3 is hereby added as follows:

12.3.6.3 The sprinklers shall be kept in a
cabinet located where the temperature to
which they are subjected will at no time exceed
100 °F (38°C).

7. Section 12.3.6.4 is hereby added as follows:

12.3.6.4 A special sprinkler wrench shall be
provided and kept in the cabinet to be used in
the removal and installation of sprinklers. One
sprinkler wrench shall be provided for each
type of sprinkler installed.

Section 7. The amendments to the California Building Code, California
Electrical Code, California Mechanical Code, California Plumbing Code, California
Green Building Standards Code, and California Residential Code herein have been
adopted pursuant to Public Resources Code Section 4117 and Health and Safety Code
Section 18941.5 and have been justified by the local conditions prevalent in the City of
San Clemente as more particularly described in City Council Resolution No. ______
incorporate herein by this reference as if set forth in full.

Section 8. If any portion of this Ordinance, or the application of any such
provision to any person or circumstance, shall be held invalid, the remainder of this
Ordinance to the extent it can be given effect, of the application of such provision to
persons or circumstances other than those as to which it is held invalid, shall not be
affected thereby, and to this extent the provisions of this Ordinance are severable.

Section 9. This Ordinance shall become effective January 1, 2014.
Section 10. The City Clerk shall certify to the passage of this Ordinance and

cause the same to be published as required by law and the same shall take effect as
provided by law.

66

797



APPROVED AND ADOPTED this day of , 2013.

ATTEST
CITY CLERK of the City of Mayor of the City of
San Clemente, California San Clemente, California

67 44-79



STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
COUNTY OF ORANGE ) ss.
CITY OF SAN CLEMENTE )

I, JOANNE BAADE, City Clerk of the City of San Clemente, California, hereby

certify that Ordinance No. having been regularly introduced at the meeting
of , was again introduced, the reading in full thereof
unanimously waived and duly passed and adopted at a regular meeting of the City
Council held on the day of , and said ordinance was

adopted by the following vote:
AYES:

NOES:

ABSENT:

IN WITNESS WHERE OF, | have hereunto set my hand and affixed the official seal of
the City of San Clemente, California, this day of , :

CITY CLERK of the City of
San Clemente, California

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

City Attorney

i:\building\2013 code adoption - final versions\2013 bldg_code_ord final-san_clemente.doc

68 4 . X’b



Attachment — 3

Attachment “3”

744/



RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SAN CLEMENTE, CALIFORNIA, SETTING FORTH
FINDINGS WITH RESPECT TO LOCAL CONDITIONS
WITHIN THE CITY OF SAN CLEMENTE WHICH MAKE
CERTAIN MODIFICATIONS AND CHANGES TO THE
CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, THE CALIFORNIA
PLUMBING CODE, THE CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL
CODE, THE CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE, THE
CALIFORNIA  RESIDENTIAL CODE, AND THE
CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE
REASONABLY NECESSARY FOR VARIOUS
OCCUPANCIES

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958 mandates that the City of San
Clemente adopt ordinances or regulations imposing the requirements of certain uniform
industry codes adopted by the State pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section 17922;

and

WHEREAS, the State of California is mandated by Health & Safety Code Section 17922
to impose the same requirements as are contained in the most recent edition of the
California Building Code (CBC), the California Plumbing Code (CPC), the California
Mechanical Code (CMC), the California Electrical Code (CEC), the California
Residential Code (CRC) and the California Green Building Standards Code (CGBSC)

(hereinafter referred to collectively as “Codes”); and

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 permits the City to make such
changes or modifications to the Codes as are reasonably necessary because of local

conditions; and

WHEREAS, the Building Official and Director of Community Development have
recommended that changes and modifications be made to the Codes and have advised
that certain of said changes and modifications to the California Building Code, 2013
Edition; the California Plumbing Code, 2013 Edition; the California Mechanical Code,
2013 Edition; the California Electrical Code, 2013 Edition; the California Residential
Code, 2013 Edition; and the California Green Building Standards Code, 2013 Edition,
are reasonably necessary due to local conditions in the City of San Clemente and have
further advised that the remainder of said changes and modifications are of an
administrative or procedural nature, or concern themselves with subjects not covered by
the Code or are reasonably necessary to safeguard life and property within the City of

San Clemente.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council for the City of San
Clemente as follows:

1 %ﬁa [ Za



SECTION 1. The Council finds and determines there is a need to adopt the
changes or modifications to the Codes because of general local climatic, topographical,
geological and related geographic conditions as follows:

Climatic Conditions
A. The jurisdiction of San Clemente is located in a semi-arid Mediterranean type

climate. It annually experiences extended periods of high temperatures with
little or no precipitation. Hot, dry (Santa Ana) winds, which may reach speeds
of 70 m.p.h. or greater are also common to the area. These climatic conditions
cause extreme drying of vegetation and common building materials. Frequent
periods of drought and low humidity add to the fire danger. This predisposes
the area to large destructive fires (conflagration). In addition to directly
damaging or destroying buildings, these fires also disrupt utility services
throughout the area.

B. The climate alternates between extended periods of drought and brief flooding
conditions. Flood conditions may affect the local fire authority’s ability to
respond to a fire or emergency condition. Floods also disrupt utility services to
buildings and facilities within the City.

C. Water demand in this densely populated area far exceeds the quantity
supplied by natural precipitation; and, although the population continues to
grow, the already-taxed water supply does not. California is projected to
increase in population by nearly 10 million over the next quarter of a century
with 50 percent of that growth centered in Southern California. Due to storage
capacities and consumption and a limited amount of rainfall, future water
allocation is not fully dependable. This necessitates the need for additional on-
site fire protection features. The shortage of water would also leave tall
buildings vulnerable to uncontrolled fires due to a lack of available water and
an inability to pump sufficient quantities of available water to upper floors in a
fire.

D. These dry climatic conditions and winds contribute to the rapid spread of even
small fires originating in high-density housing or vegetation. These fires
spread very quickly and create a need for increased levels of fire protection.
The added protection of fire sprinkler systems and other fire protection
features will supplement normal fire department response by providing
immediate protection for the building occupants and by containing and
controlling the fire spread to the area of origin. Fire sprinkler systems will also
reduce the use of water for firefighting by as much as 50 to 75 percent.

Il Topographical conditions:
A. Natural slopes of 15 percent or greater generally occur throughout the the
City. The elevation change caused by the hills creates the geological
- foundation on which communities within the City are built and will continue to
built. With much of the populated flatlands already built upon, future growth
will occur on steeper slopes and greater constraints in terrain.
B. Traffic and circulation congestion is an artificially created, obstructive
topographical condition, which is common throughout the City.
C. These topographical conditions combine to create a situation, which places
fire department response time to fire occurrences at risk, and makes it s




necessary to provide automatic on-site fire-extinguishing systems and other
protection measures to protect occupants and property.

. Geological conditions:

A. The City is a densely populated area that has buildings constructed over
and/or near a vast and complex network of faults that are believed to be
capable of producing future earthquakes similar or greater in size than the
1994 Northridge and the 1971 Sylmar earthquakes. Earthquake faults run
along the northeast and southwest boundaries of Orange County. The
Newport-Inglewood Fault, located within Orange County was the source of the
destructive 1933 Long Beach earthquake (6.3 magnitude) which took 120 lives
and damaged buildings in an area that ran from Laguna Beach to Marina del
Rey to Whittier. In December 1989, another earthquake occurred in the City
of Irvine at an unknown fault line. Regional planning for reoccurrence of
earthquakes is recommended by the State of California, Department of
Conservation.

B. Previous earthquakes have been accompanied by disruption of traffic flow and
fires. A severe seismic event has the potential to negatively impact any
rescue or fire suppression activities because it is likely to create obstacles
similar to those indicated under sections above. With the probability of strong
aftershocks there exists a need to provide increased protection for anyone on
upper floors of buildings. The October 17, 1989, Santa Cruz earthquake
resulted in one major fire in the Marina District (San Francisco). When
combined with the 34 other fires locally and over 500 responses, the
department was taxed to its fullest capabilities. The Marina fire was difficult to
contain because mains supplying water to the district burst during the
earthquake. This situation creates the need for both additional fire protection
and automatic on-site fire protection for building occupants. The State
Department of Conservation noted, in their 1988 report (Planning Scenario on
a Major Earthquake on the Newport Inglewood Fault Zone, page 59),
“‘unfortunately, barely meeting the minimum earthquake standards of building
codes places a building on the verge of being legally unsafe.”

C. Road circulation features located throughout the City also make amendments
reasonably necessary. There are major roadways, highways and flood control
channels that create barriers and slow response times. Hills, slopes, street
and storm drain design accompanied by occasional heavy rainfall, cause
roadway flooding and landslides and at times may make an emergency
access route impassable.

D. Soils throughout the City posses corrosive properties that reduce the expected
usable life of water services when metallic pipes come in contact with these
soils.

E. Expansive soils throughout the City combined with predominant hillside
conditions, groundwater and occasional flooding raise the potential for ground
slippage, ground erosion, slope failure and building damage.

SECTION 2. In addition to the general findings in Section 1, above, specific
changes and modifications to the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code, as
recommended by the Building Official and Director of Community Development, are
hereby found to be reasonably necessary as follows:

3 G94- §4



Subsection 107.2.6 is added to require soils reports for projects due to
general finding numbers IIA, 1A, IlIE in Section 1, above.

Section 403 and Subsection 403.1 of Section 403, relating to high-rise
buildings, are amended to coordinate with Fire Code provisions due to
general finding numbers IA, 1B, IC, ID, 1A, IIB, IIC, IlIA, 1B, and HIC in
Section 1, above.

Subsections 406.3.3 and 406.4.5 of Section 406 are amended to prohibit the
use of asphaltic paving for covered parking area because asphaltic paving
cannot be reinforced to prevent cracking and settlement due to general
finding numbers IIA, IlIA, lIB, and IIIE in Section 1, above.

Subsection 412.7.6 of Section 412, relating to Emergency Helicopter Landing
Facilities are amended to coordinate with Fire Code due to general finding
numbers IA, 1B, IC, ID, lIA, 1B, IIC, IlIA, lIB, and IlIC in Section 1, above.

Subsections 710A.3.2 and 710A.4 of Section 710A, relating to construction of
accessory structures in Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones are amended
due to general finding numbers IA, IB, IC, ID, 1IA, 1IB, IIC, 1A, lIB, and IlIC in

Section 1, above.

Subsections 903.2, 903.2.8, 903.3.5.3, and 903.4 of Section 903 are
amended to require automatic fire sprinkler systems in certain occupancies
and to coordinate with Fire Code provisions due to general finding numbers
IA, 1B, IC, ID, IIA, lIB, IIC, llIA, HIB, and IlIC in Section 1, above.

Subsection 905.4 of Section 905 and Subsections 907.2.13, 907.3.1,
907.5.2.2, 907.6.3.2 and 907.6.5 of Section 907 amend automatic fire
sprinkler systems and fire detection systems in certain occupancies and
coordinate with Fire Code provisions due to general finding numbers IA, IB,
IC, ID, A, 1IB, liC, llIA, IlIB, and llIC in Section 1, above.

Subsection 1503.4 of Section 1503 has been amended to require drainage
devices on roofs to be effectively drained and conveyed to the street or other
approved locations to minimize water absorption into typical expansive soils
due to general finding numbers IIA and IlIE in Section 1, above.

Table 1505.1 and Subsections 1505.1.1, 1505.1.2 and 1505.1.3 of Section
1505 are amended to prohibit use of untreated non-fire retardant wood
materials for roofing due to general finding numbers IA, IB, IC, ID, HA, IIB,
and IIC in Section 1, above, and the fact that untreated wood roofs cause or
contribute to the serious fire hazard and to the rapid spread of fires when
such fires are accompanied by high winds common to the City. Pieces of
burning wooden roofs become flying brands and are carried by the wind to
other locations and thereby spread fire rapidly. Flying brands only occur with
wood roofs and not with other commonly used roofing materials.

‘ 74-95



J. Subsection 1807.1.6 of Section 1807 is amended to prohibit the use of
prescriptive design approach for foundation walls in seismic design categories
D, E, and F due to general finding numbers IlIA 1IIB and IlIE in Section 1,
above, and with the higher seismic demand placed on buildings and
structures in this region, it is deemed necessary to take precautionary steps
to reduce or eliminate potential problems that may result by following
prescriptive design provisions that does not take into consideration the
surrounding environment. In addition, no substantiating data has been
provided to show that under-reinforced foundation walls are effective in
resisting seismic loads and may potentially lead to a higher risk of failure. It is
important that the benefit and expertise of a registered design professional be
obtained to properly analyze the structure and take these issues into
consideration.

K. Subsections 3109.3, 3109.4.1, 3109.4.4.1, and 3109.4.4.3 of Section 3109
relating to pool enclosure barriers have been amended due to the high
number of swimming pools within close proximity to small children as a resuit
of the local climatic conditions which make pool ownership desirable.

L. Subsection 3109.7 of Section 3109 relating to pool equipment has been
added due to topographical conditions in the City where slopes and hilly
streets enhance the potential for pool equipment to create a noise nuisance to
the neighbors. Furthermore, climatic conditions in the City, including coastal
marine layers, create conditions where noises are intensified.

M. Subsections 3410.2 and 3410.3 of Section 3408 are amended to add special
requirements and a permit process for moved structures to make sure the
safety of the occupants is maintained due to general finding numbers lIA, IlIA,
[lIB, and IIIE in Section 1, above.

N. NFPA Standards (NFPA 13, NFPA 13D, NFPA 13R, NFPA 14, NFPA 24)
referenced in Chapter 45 amend automatic fire sprinkler systems and fire
detection systems in certain occupancies and coordinate with Fire Code
provisions due to general finding numbers IA, 1B, IC, ID, lIA, 1B, lIC, llIA, 1B,
and IlIC in Section 1, above.

SECTION 3. In addition to the general findings in Section 1, above, specific
changes and maodifications to the 2013 Edition of the California Plumbing Code, as
recommended by the Building Official and Director of Community Development, are
hereby found to be reasonably necessary as follows:

A. Subsection 604.10f Section 604 has been amended to restrict the use of
ferrous metal water piping when used in the ground due to general finding
number IlID in Section 1, above. The type of soil prevalent in the City of San
Clemente is extraordinarily high in sulfates and acid content. The sulfate
content causes corrosion of the prohibited material and the acid content
promotes electrolysis which similarly caused the prohibited materials to
corrode at an accelerated rate.

2 IH -8



B. Subsections 604.2 of Section 604 and Subsection 609.3(2) of Section 609 are
amended to require the use of thicker walled copper water piping when
installed in the ground due to general finding number lID in Section 1, above.
The type of soil prevalent in the City of San Clemente is extraordinarily high in
sulfates and acid content. The sulfate content causes corrosion of the
prohibited material and the acid content promotes electrolysis which similarly
caused the prohibited materials to corrode at an accelerated rate.

C. Subsection 610.8 of Section 610 is amended to require larger water pipe
supply lines to residences due to general finding numbers IA, IC, ID, lIA, IIB,
[IC, A, 1lIB, and IlIC in Section 1, above. These modifications are to insure
enough water supply is provided to accommodate efficient operation of the

emergency fire sprinkler system.

D. Subsection 701.1(7) is amended to restrict the use of cast iron drainage and
waste piping when used in the ground due to general finding number UlID in
Section 1, above. The type of soil prevalent in the City of San Clemente is
extraordinarily high in sulfates and acid content. The sulfate content causes
corrosion of the prohibited material and the acid content promotes electrolysis
which similarly caused the prohibited materials to corrode at an accelerated

rate.

E: Subsection 1208.5 of Section 1208 is amended to restrict the use of ferrous
gas piping for underground condition due to general finding number IlID in
Section 1, above. The type of soil prevalent in the City of San Clemente is
extraordinarily high in sulfates and acid content. The sulfate content causes
corrosion of the prohibited material and the acid content promotes electrolysis
which similarly caused the prohibited materials to corrode at an accelerated

rate.

SECTION 4. In addition to the general findings in Section 1, above, specific
changes and modifications to the 2013 Edition of the California Mechanical Code, as
recommended by the Building Official and Director of Community Development, are
hereby found to be reasonably necessary as follows:

A Subsection 504.2 of Section 504 is amended to require a ventilation system
for domestic cooking equipment in the kitchen due to climatic conditions in the
City where hot, dry and calm air conditions during certain times of the year
can create poor ventilation. This requirement will enhance the safety and
living condition for occupants.

B. Subsection 1308.5 of Section 1308 is amended to restrict the use of ferrous
gas piping for underground condition due to general finding number HID in
Section 1, above. The type of soil prevalent in the City of San Clemente is
extraordinarily high in sulfates and acid content. The sulfate content causes
corrosion of the prohibited material and the acid content promotes electrolysis

0 4447



which similarly caused the prohibited materials to corrode at an accelerated
rate.

SECTION 5. In addition to the general findings in Section 1, above, specific
changes and modifications to the 2013 Edition of the California Electrical Code, as
recommended by the Building Official and Director of Community Development, are
hereby found to be reasonably necessary as follows:

A. Subsection 300.5(L) of Article 300 is amended to limit outside overhead
wiring due to general finding numbers 1A, 1IB, llIA, 1IB, and IliIC in Section 1,
above.

B. Subsection 310.106(B) of Article 310 is amended to restrict the use of
aluminum wiring due to general findings 1A, lIA, IIIB, and IlIE in Section 1,
above. Stricter standards for electrical wiring will reduce the risk of fires and
enhance the safety of building occupants.

C. Table 310.106(A) is amended to restrict the use of aluminum wiring due to
general finding numbers IA, llIA, llIB, and IlIE in Section 1, above. Stricter
standards for electrical wiring will reduce the risk of fires and enhance the

safety of building occupants.

SECTION 6. In addition to the general findings in Section 1, above, specific
changes and modifications to the 2013 Edition of the California Residential Code, as
recommended by the Building Official and Director of Community Development, are
hereby found to be reasonably necessary as follows:

A. Subsection R106.1.4 of Section R106 is added to require soils reports for
projects due to general finding numbers 1A, llIA, IIIE in Section 1, above.

B. Subsection R301.9 of Section R301 is amended to require special studies
due to special geotechnical and topographical conditions associated with
development on or near land containing or emitting toxic, combustible or
flammable liquids, gases or vapors.

C. Subsection R301.10 of Section R301 is amended to require fuel modification
due to general finding numbers IA, IB, IC, ID, llA, liB, and IIC in Section 1,
above, and the fact that hazardous combustible vegetation cause or
contribute to the serious fire hazard and to the rapid spread of fires when
such fires are accompanied by high winds common to the City.

D. Table R302.1(2) is amended eliminating the special allowance of reduced fire
separation for zero lot line subdivisions due to general finding numbers IA, IB,
IC, ID, llA, 1IB, and lIC in Section 1, above and the fact that the lack of
adequate building setbacks cause or contribute to the serious fire hazard and

to the rapid spread of fires.
7 7488



Subsections R313.1, R313.2, and R313.3.6.2.2 of Section R313 are
amended to require automatic fire sprinkler systems in certain occupancies
and to coordinate with Fire Code provisions due to general finding numbers
IA, IB, IC, ID, A, IIB, lIC, and HlIA, 1B, IlIC in Section 1, above.

Subsection R319.1 of Section R319 is amended to require approved building
address numbers and to coordinate with Fire Code provisions due to general
finding numbers IA, 1B, IC, ID, llA, 1B, IIC, and IlIA, 1IIB, IHIC in Section 1,

above.

Subsection R327.1.6 is amended to require fuel modification due to general
finding numbers IA, IB, IC, ID, lIA, IB, and IIC in Section 1, above, and the
fact that hazardous combustible vegetation cause or contribute to the serious
fire hazard and to the rapid spread of fires when such fires are accompanied

by high winds common to the City.

Subsection R403.1.3 of Section R403 is amended to require minimum
reinforcement for concrete footings due topography and geologic conditions
related to general finding numbers 1A and 111B in Section 1, above that create
conditions where geological conditions such as expansive soils, groundwater
condition may create structural damages to the building and endanger the
safety of the occupants.

Subsection R405.1 of Section R405 is amended to eliminate exception to
foundation drainage due topography and geologic conditions related to
general finding numbers IlIA and IlIB in Section 1, above that create
conditions where geological conditions such as expansive soils, groundwater
condition may create structural damages to the building and endanger the
safety of the occupants.

Table R602.10.3(3) is amended to increase the length and limits the location
where shear walls sheathed with lath, plaster or gypsum board are used in
multi-level buildings due to general finding numbers IlIA 1lIB and IlIE in
Section 1, above. In addition, shear walls sheathed with other materials are
prohibited in Seismic Design Category Do, D1 and D3 to be consistent with the
design limitation for similar shear walls found in the California Building Code.
The poor performance of such shear walls in the 1994 Northridge Earthquake
was investigated by the Structural Engineers Association of Southern
California (SEAOSC) and the Los Angeles City Task Force and formed the
basis for this proposed amendment. Considering that shear walls sheathed
with lath, plaster or gypsum board are less ductile than steel moment frames
or wood structural panel shear walls, the cities and county of the Los Angeles
region has taken the necessary measures to limit the potential structural
damage that may be caused by the use of such walls at the lower level of
multi-level building that are subject to higher levels of seismic loads.

Subsections R902.1, R902.1.1 and R902.2 of Section R902 are amended to
prohibit use of untreated non-fire retardant wood materials for roofing due to

X 7H-54



general finding numbers IA, IB, IC, ID, lIA, 1I1B, and lIC in Section 1, above,
and the fact that untreated wood roofs cause or contribute to the serious fire
hazard and to the rapid spread of fires when such fires are accompanied by
high winds common to the City. Pieces of burning wooden roofs become
flying brands and are carried by the wind to other locations and thereby
spread fire rapidly. Flying brands only occur with wood roofs and not with
other commonly used roofing materials.

L. Subsection R903.4 of Section R903 has been amended to require drainage
devices on roofs to be effectively drained and conveyed to the street or other
approved locations to minimize water absorption into typical expansive soils
due to general finding numbers IIA and IIIE in Section 1, above.

M. NFPA Standards (NFPA 13, NFPA 13D, NFPA 13R) referenced in Chapter
44 amend automatic fire sprinkler systems and fire detection systems in
certain occupancies and coordinate with Fire Code provisions due to general
finding numbers IA, IB, IC, ID, lIA, IIB, IIC, llIA, 1B, and llIC in Section 1,

above.

SECTION 7. In addition to the general findings in Section 1, above, specific
changes and modifications to the 2013 Edition of the California Green Building
Standards Code, as recommended by the Building Official and Director of Community
Development, are hereby found to be reasonably necessary as follows:

A. Subsection 4.304.1 of Section 4.304 is amended to ensure that all new
irrigation controllers installed meet the minimum standards and minimize
landscape water usage due to limited water and general finding number IC in

Section 1, above.

SECTION 8. Additional amendments are found to be either administrative or
procedural in nature or to concern themselves with subjects not covered in the Codes.
The changes made include provisions making each of said Codes compatible with other
codes enforced by the City and fee schedules.

SECTION 9. A copy of this Resolution together with the Ordinance adopting the
California Building Code, 2013 Edition as amended; the California Plumbing Code, 2013
Edition, as amended; the California Mechanical Code, 2013 Edition, as amended; the
California Electrical Code, 2013 Edition, as amended; the California Residential Code,
2013 Edition, as amended; and the Califomia Green Building Standards Code, 2013
Edition, as amended shall be filed with the California Department of Housing and
Community Development and the California Building Standard Commission by the City
Clerk of the City of San Clemente.

Section 10. The City Clerk shall certify to the passage and adoption of this
resolution and enter it into the book of original resolutions.

GH90



Resolution No. Page 2

PASSED AND ADOPTED this day of ,
ATTEST:
City Clerk of the City of Mayor of the City of San
San Clemente, California Clemente, California

STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
COUNTY OF ORANGE ) §
CITY OF SAN CLEMENTE )

I, JOANNE BAADE, City Clerk of the City of San Clemente, California, do hereby certify

that Resolution No. was adopted at a regular meeting of the City Council of the

City of San Clemente held on the day of ,
, by the following vote:

AYES:

NOES:

ABSENT:

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, | have hereunto set my hand and affixed the official seal of
the City of San Clemente, California, this day of .

CITY CLERK of the City of
San Clemente, California

Approved as to form:

City Attorney

GH-9/



